
         
            

  

            
 

 
  

  
     

        
       

♦ ♦ ♦ 
PART 4. TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF 
LICENSING AND REGULATION 
CHAPTER 65. BOILERS 
The Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation (Depart-
ment) proposes amendments to existing rules at 16 Texas 
Administrative Code (TAC), Chapter 65, Subchapter A, §65.2; 
Subchapter C, §65.13; Subchapter N, §65.206 and §65.214; 
Subchapter O, §65.300; and Subchapter R, §65.603 and 
§65.607, regarding the Boilers Program. These proposed 
changes are referred to as "proposed rules." 
EXPLANATION OF AND JUSTIFICATION FOR THE RULES 
The rules under 16 TAC Chapter 65 implement Texas Health and 
Safety Code, Chapter 755, Boilers. 
The proposed rules are the product of analysis and discussion 
among the staff and with the Board of Boiler Rules. The primary 
focus and goal are the protection of public health, safety, and 
welfare. All participants agreed that it is necessary to that protec-
tion to implement a simple method to prevent additional deaths 
and injuries to Texans. Other unrelated changes are included in 
the proposal relating to administrative matters and overall clarity 
in the rules. 
The proposed rules include three components. First, a carbon 
monoxide (CO) detector and interlock system is newly required 
for boilers installed in boiler rooms on or after June 1, 2020, 
which will significantly reduce deaths and injuries resulting from 
CO poisoning. This requirement is necessary to protect public 
health, safety, and welfare. Second, the proposed rules provide 
the Department the opportunity to address public comments re-
ceived during the most recent four-year review of the boiler rules. 
Finally, the proposed rules make edits and clarifications for con-
sistency and understandability. 
The proposed rules were presented to and discussed by the 
Board of Boiler Rules at its meeting on November 7, 2019. The 
Board did not make any changes to the proposed rules. The 
Board voted and recommended that the proposed rules be pub-
lished in the Texas Register for public comment. 
SECTION-BY-SECTION SUMMARY 
The amendments to §65.2 update the Modular Boiler definition 
and clarify the Authorized Inspector definition. 
The amendments to §65.13 add clarifying wording for temporary 
boiler operating permits. 

The amendments to §65.206 update the name of the section 
to reflect its increased scope and add the requirement for a 
CO detector and interlock system to disable the burners of any 
CO-producing boiler if the concentration of CO in the boiler 
room reaches a dangerous level. The amendments also specify 
applicability and update citations. The section is renumbered 
accordingly. 
The amendments to §65.214 update wording for a modular 
boiler requirement consistent with the revised definition of 
Modular Boiler, and update a citation. 
Amendments to §65.300 make clarifying wording changes. 
The amendments to §65.603 reword existing boiler room ven-
tilation requirements to more clearly describe both applicability 
and the ventilation options. 
The amendment to §65.607 corrects a citation. 
Texas Government Code, §2001.039 requires state agencies to 
review their rules every four years to determine if the reasons for 
initially adopting the rules continue to exist. The Notice of Intent 
to Review the boiler rules was published in the Texas Register 
on August 24, 2018 (43 TexReg 5545). During the subsequent 
public comment period two comments were submitted. The con-
tent of the comments and the conclusion of the review process 
appeared in the Texas Register on February 8, 2019 (44 TexReg 
594). No changes to the boiler rules were made during the rule 
review process and none are being proposed in this rulemaking 
that are related to the rule review. However, the Department is 
taking this opportunity to address those comments as part of the 
response to the comments received for this proposed rule. 
FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE AND LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
Tony Couvillon, Policy Research and Budget Analyst, has deter-
mined that for each year of the first five years the proposed rules 
are in effect, there are no estimated additional costs or reduc-
tions in costs to state or local government as a result of enforc-
ing or administering the proposed rules. Mr. Couvillon has also 
determined that there will be no increase or loss of revenue to 
local governments or to the state. 
LOCAL EMPLOYMENT IMPACT STATEMENT 
Mr. Couvillon has determined that the proposed rules will not 
affect any local economies, so the agency is not required to pre-
pare a local employment impact statement under Government 
Code §2001.022. 
PUBLIC BENEFITS 
Mr. Couvillon has determined that for each year of the first 
five-year period the proposed rule requiring the CO detector and 
interlock system is in effect, the public benefit will be lives saved 
and illnesses avoided, a significant benefit to public health, 
safety, and welfare. In the last six years the Department has 
completed 13 carbon monoxide accident investigations related 
to boiler rooms. Each accident resulted in either multiple injuries, 
fatalities, or both. Three of these incidents occurred at schools 
where several hundred children and teachers were treated for 
CO exposure either at the school or were transported to a local 
hospital for care. Five of the incidents occurred at hotels in 
which exposure resulted in the injured being transported to the 
hospital. Five of the incidents occurred at apartment complexes. 
Two of these incidents involved three fatalities and multiple 
tenants were injured. Most or all of these incidents could have 
been prevented had CO detection and interlock systems been 
in place. In addition to saving lives and preventing injuries from 

PROPOSED RULES January 31, 2020 45 TexReg 683 

 
  

Texas Register 
Jan. 31, 2020



CO poisoning, the benefits to the public of the new interlock 
requirement will include reduced hospitalizations and medical 
expenses, and reduced need for emergency response services. 
Multiple edits in the amended sections including updates, cor-
rections, and improved word choices make the boiler rules more 
understandable and easier to use. These improvements and the 
increased clarity of the updated boiler room ventilation require-
ments will facilitate easier compliance with these requirements 
by the affected regulated entities. 
PROBABLE ECONOMIC COSTS TO PERSONS REQUIRED 
TO COMPLY WITH PROPOSAL 
Mr. Couvillon has determined that for each year of the first five-
year period the proposed rules are in effect, there will be addi-
tional costs to persons who are required to comply with portions 
of the proposed rules. For those entities affected, the anticipated 
cost to purchase and install a CO detector and interlock system 
is estimated to be approximately $750 to buy the system and ap-
proximately $250 for installation, totaling approximately $1,000 
per boiler room. The cost to buy and install the system is not 
expected to be significantly higher for boiler rooms with multiple 
boilers. The cost to calibrate the system periodically following 
installation is not anticipated to add to the routine costs of boiler 
maintenance. 
FISCAL IMPACT ON SMALL BUSINESSES, MICRO-BUSI-
NESSES, AND RURAL COMMUNITIES 
With the exception of the rule requiring CO detectors and inter-
lock systems to be installed in boiler rooms, there will be no 
adverse effect on small businesses, micro-businesses, or ru-
ral communities as a result of the proposed rules. Because 
the agency has determined that this requirement will have an 
adverse economic effect on small businesses and micro-busi-
nesses the agency has prepared an Economic Impact Statement 
and a Regulatory Flexibility Analysis, as detailed and required 
under Texas Government Code §2006.002. 
Economic Impact Statement 
The requirement to install a CO detector and interlock system 
applies to all new and existing boiler rooms in Texas containing 
boilers installed or reinstalled after June 1, 2020 that are regu-
lated by the Department and that can produce CO. Virtually any 
entity that uses hot water, including entities such as apartment 
complexes, hospitals, and nursing homes, uses boilers to heat 
water. Other affected entities include public and private schools, 
government buildings, warehouses, restaurants, hotels, fitness 
centers, and breweries. Currently about 53,500 boilers regu-
lated by the Department are installed in Texas. Approximately 
3,000 boilers are installed outside (industrial boilers) and are not 
affected by the proposed CO detector and interlock requirement. 
Approximately 5% of existing boiler rooms are already required 
by their design to have a CO detector and interlock system. Ap-
proximately 2,000 new and existing boiler rooms have a boiler 
installed each year. Existing boiler rooms that do not have boil-
ers added are not affected by the proposed requirement. 
Approximately 20% of boiler installations annually take place 
at small or micro-businesses so approximately 400 small and 
micro-businesses will be subject to the proposed CO detector 
and interlock system requirement when they install CO-produc-
ing boilers each year over the next five years. The CO de-
tector and interlock system needs to be installed only once in 
each affected boiler room. Among the small and micro-business 
types affected are dry cleaners, hotels, apartment complexes, 

and breweries. Implementation of the proposed rules would re-
quire all boiler rooms with new or reinstalled CO-producing boil-
ers to be equipped with a CO detector that will shut off all CO-pro-
ducing boilers in the room if the concentration of CO in the boiler 
room exceeds 50 parts per million (the Occupational Health and 
Safety Administration permissible exposure limit). 
The anticipated cost to purchase and install a CO detector inter-
lock system is estimated to be approximately $1,000 per boiler 
room (approximately $750 to buy the system and approximately 
$250 for installation). The cost to buy and install the system is not 
expected to be significantly higher for boiler rooms with multiple 
boilers. The cost to calibrate the system periodically following 
installation is not expected to add to the routine costs of boiler 
maintenance. The requirement to install the CO detector and 
interlock system is a one-time cost and any subsequent activi-
ties related to calibrating the detector are expected to be part of 
routine maintenance. Additional cost for calibration in the years 
following installation should be none to insignificant. 
No alternative methods exist that would achieve the purpose of 
the proposed rule. The CO detector and interlock system func-
tions to immediately disable the burners of the boiler(s) in the 
boiler room when the CO concentration exceeds 50 ppm, effec-
tively shutting the boiler(s) down and preventing further emis-
sions of CO. The increase of CO concentration in the boiler room 
inevitably results from a malfunction requiring professional atten-
tion to restore proper operability. 
Some boiler rooms have an interlock system that shuts the 
boiler(s) down in the event of a fire, but such a system does not 
provide protection against dangerous levels of CO and therefore 
cannot substitute for it. Likewise, an alarm-only system is in-
sufficient because any response to address the problem would 
not result in immediate shutdown, and thus would not prevent 
further accumulation of CO and would not provide protection of 
the health and safety of nearby occupants or repair personnel 
prior to eventual response to the alarm. Further, the length of 
time necessary to respond to an alarm could and would vary 
widely and would not invariably result in halting the continued 
buildup of CO before disastrous consequences could occur. 
Regulatory Flexibility Analysis 
As discussed in the Economic Impact Statement, the purpose of 
the proposed rules is to protect the health, safety, and welfare of 
the public, and there are no alternative regulatory methods avail-
able to achieve that purpose. An alarm system would not offer 
the immediate and absolute protection of health and safety that 
the CO detector and interlock system provides, and therefore it 
is not a reasonable or suitable alternative. 
The Department considered imposing the new requirement on 
existing facilities but decided that requiring retrofitting would be 
unduly burdensome, especially on small and micro-businesses. 
Because the new requirement will apply to boilers installed and 
reinstalled after June 1, 2020, owners will have reasonable time 
to design the CO detector and interlock system into the boiler 
installation plan and complete it at installation, thus avoiding ret-
rofitting and additional visits by installation personnel. This will 
help to minimize the adverse impacts on small and micro-busi-
nesses. 
ONE-FOR-ONE REQUIREMENT FOR RULES WITH A FISCAL 
IMPACT 
The proposed rules have a fiscal note that imposes a cost on reg-
ulated persons who must install a CO detector and interlock sys-

45 TexReg 684 January 31, 2020 Texas Register 



tem. However, the proposed rules falls under the exception for 
rules that are necessary to protect the health, safety, and welfare 
of the residents of this state under §2001.0045(c)(6). Because 
of the applicable exception the agency is not required to take any 
further action under Government Code §2001.0045. 
GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT 
Pursuant to Government Code §2001.0221, the agency provides 
the following Government Growth Impact Statement for the pro-
posed rules. For each year of the first five years the proposed 
rules will be in effect, the agency has determined the following: 
1. The proposed rules do not create or eliminate a government 
program. 
2. Implementation of the proposed rules does not require the 
creation of new employee positions or the elimination of existing 
employee positions. 
3. Implementation of the proposed rules does not require an 
increase or decrease in future legislative appropriations to the 
agency. 
4. The proposed rules do not require an increase or decrease in 
fees paid to the agency. 
5. The proposed rules do not create a new regulation. 
6. The proposed rules expand, limit, or repeal an existing regu-
lation. 
7. The proposed rules increase or decrease the number of indi-
viduals subject to the rule's applicability. 
8. The proposed rules do not positively or adversely affect this 
state's economy. 
Approximately 2,000 new and existing boiler rooms have a boiler 
installed each year. Existing boiler rooms that do not have boilers 
added are not affected by the proposed requirement. Roughly 
5% of existing boiler rooms are already required by their design 
to have a CO detector and interlock system. Approximately 20% 
of boiler installations annually take place at small or micro-busi-
nesses so about 400 small and micro-businesses will now be 
subject to the proposed CO detector and interlock system re-
quirement when they install CO-producing boilers each year over 
the next five years. 
TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT 
The Department has determined that no private real property in-
terests are affected by the proposed rules and the proposed rules 
do not restrict, limit, or impose a burden on an owner's rights to 
his or her private real property that would otherwise exist in the 
absence of government action. As a result, the proposed rules 
do not constitute a taking or require a takings impact assessment 
under Government Code §2007.043. 
PUBLIC COMMENTS 
Comments on the proposed rules may be submitted to Dalma 
Sotero, Assistant General Counsel, Texas Department of Li-
censing and Regulation, PO Box 12157, Austin, Texas 78711, 
or facsimile (512) 475-3032, or electronically: erule.com-
ments@tdlr.texas.gov. The deadline for comments is 30 days 
after publication in the Texas Register. 
SUBCHAPTER A. GENERAL PROVISIONS 
16 TAC §65.2 
STATUTORY AUTHORITY 

The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations 
Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 
755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and 
Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules 
as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law 
establishing a program regulated by the Department. 
The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those 
set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas 
Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No other statutes, arti-
cles, or codes are affected by the proposed rules. 
§65.2. Definitions. 
The following words and terms, when used in this chapter, shall have 
the following meanings, unless the context clearly indicates otherwise. 

(1) - (6) (No change.) 
(7) Authorized Inspector--An inspector employed by an 

Authorized Inspection Agency who holds [authorized inspection 
agency holding] a commission issued by the executive director. 

(8) - (40) (No change.) 
(41) Modular Boiler--A [steam or hot water] heating boiler 

assembly consisting of a group of individual boilers called modules, 
intended to be installed as a unit, with a single inlet and single outlet. 
Modules may be under one jacket or may be individually jacketed. 

(42) - (69) (No change.) 
The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-
posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority 
to adopt. 

Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 16, 
2020. 
TRD-202000195 
Brad Bowman 
General Counsel 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 
Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 
For further information, please call: (512) 463-8179 

♦ ♦ ♦ 
SUBCHAPTER C. BOILER REGISTRATION 
AND CERTIFICATE OF OPERATION--
REQUIREMENTS 
16 TAC §65.13 
The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations 
Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 
755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and 
Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules 
as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law 
establishing a program regulated by the Department. 
The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those 
set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas 
Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No other statutes, arti-
cles, or codes are affected by the proposed rules. 
§65.13. Boiler Installation. 

(a) - (b) (No change.) 
(c) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit. 

PROPOSED RULES January 31, 2020 45 TexReg 685 

mailto:ments@tdlr.texas.gov
https://erule.com


(1) The owner or operator may request a Temporary Boiler 
Operating Permit on a department-approved form. 

(2) The owner or operator must pay the applicable fee 
provided [required] under §65.300. 

(3) Upon approval of the Temporary Boiler Operating Per-
mit from the department, the boiler may be operated prior to the re-
quired initial inspection for up to thirty (30) days. 
The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-
posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority 
to adopt. 

Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 16, 
2020. 
TRD-202000196 
Brad Bowman 
General Counsel 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 
Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 
For further information, please call: (512) 463-8179 

♦ ♦ ♦ 
SUBCHAPTER N. RESPONSIBILITIES OF 
THE OWNER AND OPERATOR 
16 TAC §65.206, §65.214 
The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations 
Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 
755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and 
Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules 
as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law 
establishing a program regulated by the Department. 
The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those 
set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas 
Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No other statutes, arti-
cles, or codes are affected by the proposed rules. 
§65.206. [Care of] Boiler Room. 

(a) Each boiler room containing one or more boilers from 
which carbon monoxide can be produced shall be equipped with a 
carbon monoxide detector with a manual reset. 

(1) The carbon monoxide detector and boiler(s) shall be in-
terlocked to disable the burners when the measured level of CO rises 
above 50 ppm. 

(2) The carbon monoxide detector shall disable the burners 
upon loss of power to the detector. 

(3) The carbon monoxide detector shall be calibrated in ac-
cordance with the manufacturer's recommendations or every eighteen 
months after installation of the detector. A record of calibration shall 
be posted at or near the boiler, or be readily accessible to an inspector. 

(4) The requirements in this subsection apply to boiler 
rooms in which new installations or reinstallations of one or more 
boilers are completed on or after June 1, 2020. 

(b) [(a)] The boiler room shall be free from accumulation of 
rubbish and materials that obstruct access to the boiler, its setting, or 
firing equipment. 

(c) [(b)] The storage of flammable material or gasoline-pow-
ered equipment in the boiler room is prohibited. 

(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-
tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. 

(e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. 
(f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. 
(g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, 

Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-
tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating 
practices. 

(h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, 
Care and Operation of Power Boilers [care and operation of power boil-
ers], be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. 
§65.214. Modular Boilers. 

All modular [steam heating and hot water] heating boilers that meet 
all of the requirements of ASME Code, Section IV, [HG-716,] shall be 
registered with a single Texas boiler number. 
The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-
posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority 
to adopt. 

Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 16, 
2020. 
TRD-202000197 
Brad Bowman 
General Counsel 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 
Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 
For further information, please call: (512) 463-8179 

♦ ♦ ♦ 
SUBCHAPTER O. FEES 
16 TAC §65.300 
The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations 
Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 
755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and 
Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules 
as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law 
establishing a program regulated by the Department. 
The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those 
set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas 
Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No other statutes, arti-
cles, or codes are affected by the proposed rules. 
§65.300. Fees. 

(a) - (c) (No change.) 
(d) Commission Fees. The Authorized Inspector seeking or 

holding the Commission shall make payment for the following fees: 
(1) New commission--$50 
(2) Reinstatement of commission--$50 
(3) Renewal of commission--$50 
(4) Duplicate card--$25 
(5) Reissuance of card after re-employment--$50 
(6) Late renewal fees for commissions issued under this 

chapter are provided under §60.83 of this title (relating to Late Re-
newal Fees). 

45 TexReg 686 January 31, 2020 Texas Register 



(e) Authorized Inspection Agency[/]Letter of Recognition. 
The Authorized [authorized] Inspection Agency shall make payment 
for the following fees: 

(1) Initial [Original] Application--$100 
(2) (No change.) 

(f) - (j) (No change.) 
(k) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit Fee. The owner or op-

erator shall make a $50 fee payment. 
The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-
posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority 
to adopt. 

Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 16, 
2020. 
TRD-202000198 
Brad Bowman 
General Counsel 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 
Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 
For further information, please call: (512) 463-8179 

♦ ♦ ♦ 
SUBCHAPTER R. TECHNICAL 
REQUIREMENTS 
16 TAC §65.603, §65.607 
The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations 
Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 
755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and 
Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules 
as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law 
establishing a program regulated by the Department. 
The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those 
set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas 
Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No other statutes, arti-
cles, or codes are affected by the proposed rules. 
§65.603. Boiler Room Ventilation. 

(a) Each boiler room containing one or more boilers from 
which carbon monoxide can be produced shall [The boiler room 
must] have an adequate and uninterrupted air supply to assure proper 
combustion and ventilation. 

(b) The combustion and ventilation air may be supplied by ei-
ther an unobstructed opening or by power ventilators or fans as pro-
vided below. 

(1) For a single unobstructed opening, the opening shall be 
sized on the basis of one square inch (645 square millimeters) of free 
area for each 2,000 Btu/hour (.586 kilowatts) input of the combined 
burners located in the boiler room. 

(2) For two unobstructed openings, one commencing not 
more than 12 inches (304.8 millimeters) from the ceiling of the room 
and one commencing not more than 12 inches (304.8 millimeters) 
from the floor of the room, the opening shall be sized on the basis of 
one square inch (645 square millimeters) of free area for each 3,000 
Btu/hour (.879 kilowatts) input per opening of the combined burners 
located in the boiler room. 

(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the 
basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 
kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler 
room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] 
the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-
lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler 
manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. 

(4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pressure 
in the boiler room shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters 
per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the 
combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fan 
control shall be interlocked to disable the burners unless a supply of 
combustion, ventilation and dilution air in accordance with the boiler 
manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. 

(c) Boilers of a sealed combustion design by the manufacturer 
[manufacture]. 

(1) When a boiler(s) in the boiler room is of a sealed com-
bustion design by the manufacturer [manufacture] of the boiler and 
pulls air for combustion from outside of the building, ventilation of 
the boiler room is not required [the required ventilation opening is not 
provided, the boiler room shall be equipped with a manual reset type 
Carbon Monoxide Detector. The Carbon Monoxide Detector and boiler 
shall be interlocked so that the burners will not operate when the mea-
sured level of CO rises above 100ppm. The Carbon Monoxide detector 
shall disable the appliance burners upon loss of power to the detector]. 

(2) When the boiler room is configured to include both de-
signs, i.e. a boiler(s) of a sealed combustion design by the manufacturer 
[manufacture] of the boiler that pulls air for combustion from outside 
of the building and a boiler(s) that is not of a sealed combustion de-
sign by the manufacturer [manufacture] of the boiler, the boiler room 
shall meet the ventilation requirements in subsection (b) only for the 
boiler(s) that are not of the sealed combustion design that pull air from 
outside of the building [requirements in A or B below shall be met]. 

[(A) The boiler room shall be in compliance with sub-
section (b)(1) or (b)(2)]. 

[(B) The boiler(s) that is not of the sealed combustion 
design is required to meet the ventilation requirement of subsection 
(b)(1) or (b)(2). The boiler(s) that are of the sealed combustion design 
are required to meet the ventilation requirement of subsection (c)(1).] 

[(d) Carbon Monoxide Detectors shall be calibrated every 
eighteen months and a record of calibration shall be posted at or near 
the boiler, or readily accessible to an inspector.] 
§65.607. Power Boilers, Excluding Unfired Steam Boilers and 
Process Steam Generators. 

(a) Safety valves and pressure relief valves. 
(1) - (4) (No change.) 
(5) Except for changeover valves as defined in §65.2(14) 

[§65.1(13)], other valve(s) shall not be placed: 
(A) - (B) (No change.) 

(6) - (14) (No change.) 
(b) - (i) (No change.) 

The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-
posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority 
to adopt. 

Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 16, 
2020. 

PROPOSED RULES January 31, 2020 45 TexReg 687 


	Structure Bookmarks
	Document
	Part
	Sect
	Sect
	Figure
	TITLE 1. ADMINISTRATION PART 8. TEXAS JUDICIAL COUNCIL CHAPTER 174. INDIGENT DEFENSE POLICIES AND STANDARDS SUBCHAPTER C. POLICY MONITORING REQUIREMENTS DIVISION 1. DEFINITIONS 1 TAC §174.26 The Texas Indigent Defense Commission (Commission) is a permanent Standing Committee of the Texas Judicial Council. The Commission proposes amendments to Texas Administra-tive Code, Title 1, Part 8, Chapter 174, Subchapter C, Division 1, §174.26, concerning definitions used in policy monitoring requirements. EXPLANATION
	TITLE 1. ADMINISTRATION PART 8. TEXAS JUDICIAL COUNCIL CHAPTER 174. INDIGENT DEFENSE POLICIES AND STANDARDS SUBCHAPTER C. POLICY MONITORING REQUIREMENTS DIVISION 1. DEFINITIONS 1 TAC §174.26 The Texas Indigent Defense Commission (Commission) is a permanent Standing Committee of the Texas Judicial Council. The Commission proposes amendments to Texas Administra-tive Code, Title 1, Part 8, Chapter 174, Subchapter C, Division 1, §174.26, concerning definitions used in policy monitoring requirements. EXPLANATION

	preparation of an economic impact statement and a regulatory flexibility analysis is not required. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Finally, Mr. Burkhart has determined that for each year of the first five years in which the proposed amendments are in effect, the amendments will have the following effect on government growth. The proposed amendments will not create or eliminate any government programs or employee positions. Additionally, the proposed amendments will not require an increase or de-crease in
	preparation of an economic impact statement and a regulatory flexibility analysis is not required. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Finally, Mr. Burkhart has determined that for each year of the first five years in which the proposed amendments are in effect, the amendments will have the following effect on government growth. The proposed amendments will not create or eliminate any government programs or employee positions. Additionally, the proposed amendments will not require an increase or de-crease in
	preparation of an economic impact statement and a regulatory flexibility analysis is not required. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Finally, Mr. Burkhart has determined that for each year of the first five years in which the proposed amendments are in effect, the amendments will have the following effect on government growth. The proposed amendments will not create or eliminate any government programs or employee positions. Additionally, the proposed amendments will not require an increase or de-crease in
	preparation of an economic impact statement and a regulatory flexibility analysis is not required. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Finally, Mr. Burkhart has determined that for each year of the first five years in which the proposed amendments are in effect, the amendments will have the following effect on government growth. The proposed amendments will not create or eliminate any government programs or employee positions. Additionally, the proposed amendments will not require an increase or de-crease in

	P
	Link


	(4) Policies and Standards Committee--A committee of the Commission charged with developing policies and standards related to improving indigent defense services. (5) Policy Monitor--The employee of the Commission who monitors the effectiveness of a county's indigent defense policies, stan-dards, and procedures. (6) Risk Assessment--A tool to rank each county's potential risk of not being in compliance with indigent defense laws. (7) Commission--Commission means the Texas Indigent Defense Commission. (8) Fu
	(4) Policies and Standards Committee--A committee of the Commission charged with developing policies and standards related to improving indigent defense services. (5) Policy Monitor--The employee of the Commission who monitors the effectiveness of a county's indigent defense policies, stan-dards, and procedures. (6) Risk Assessment--A tool to rank each county's potential risk of not being in compliance with indigent defense laws. (7) Commission--Commission means the Texas Indigent Defense Commission. (8) Fu
	(4) Policies and Standards Committee--A committee of the Commission charged with developing policies and standards related to improving indigent defense services. (5) Policy Monitor--The employee of the Commission who monitors the effectiveness of a county's indigent defense policies, stan-dards, and procedures. (6) Risk Assessment--A tool to rank each county's potential risk of not being in compliance with indigent defense laws. (7) Commission--Commission means the Texas Indigent Defense Commission. (8) Fu



	sure the time to when an appointment is made or when a denial of indigence determination is made, rather than when an indi-gence determination is made. --Clarify the rule related to assessing the distribution of appoint-ments to provide that only attorneys who were on the appoint-ment list for the entire time period under review will be included in the distribution analysis. --Change the section heading from "Payment Process" to "Data Reporting" to more accurately describe the processes under re-view. --Cla
	sure the time to when an appointment is made or when a denial of indigence determination is made, rather than when an indi-gence determination is made. --Clarify the rule related to assessing the distribution of appoint-ments to provide that only attorneys who were on the appoint-ment list for the entire time period under review will be included in the distribution analysis. --Change the section heading from "Payment Process" to "Data Reporting" to more accurately describe the processes under re-view. --Cla
	sure the time to when an appointment is made or when a denial of indigence determination is made, rather than when an indi-gence determination is made. --Clarify the rule related to assessing the distribution of appoint-ments to provide that only attorneys who were on the appoint-ment list for the entire time period under review will be included in the distribution analysis. --Change the section heading from "Payment Process" to "Data Reporting" to more accurately describe the processes under re-view. --Cla

	P
	Link

	The amendments are proposed under the Texas Government Code §79.037(a) and (b), which requires the Commission to monitor the effectiveness of the county's indigent defense poli-cies, standards, and procedures and to ensure compliance by the county with the requirements of state law relating to indigent defense. No other statutes, articles, or codes are affected by the proposed amendments. §174.27. Risk Assessment. (a) A risk assessment of each county shall be conducted by the policy monitoring team [monitor
	The amendments are proposed under the Texas Government Code §79.037(a) and (b), which requires the Commission to monitor the effectiveness of the county's indigent defense poli-cies, standards, and procedures and to ensure compliance by the county with the requirements of state law relating to indigent defense. No other statutes, articles, or codes are affected by the proposed amendments. §174.27. Risk Assessment. (a) A risk assessment of each county shall be conducted by the policy monitoring team [monitor
	The amendments are proposed under the Texas Government Code §79.037(a) and (b), which requires the Commission to monitor the effectiveness of the county's indigent defense poli-cies, standards, and procedures and to ensure compliance by the county with the requirements of state law relating to indigent defense. No other statutes, articles, or codes are affected by the proposed amendments. §174.27. Risk Assessment. (a) A risk assessment of each county shall be conducted by the policy monitoring team [monitor
	(c) Core Requirements. On-site policy monitoring focuses on the six core requirements of the Fair Defense Act and related rules. Pol-icy monitoring may also include a review of statutorily required reports to the Office of Court Administration and Commission. This rule estab-lishes the process for evaluating policy compliance with a requirement and sets benchmarks for determining whether a county is in substantial policy compliance with the requirement. For each of these elements, the policy monitor shall r
	(c) Core Requirements. On-site policy monitoring focuses on the six core requirements of the Fair Defense Act and related rules. Pol-icy monitoring may also include a review of statutorily required reports to the Office of Court Administration and Commission. This rule estab-lishes the process for evaluating policy compliance with a requirement and sets benchmarks for determining whether a county is in substantial policy compliance with the requirement. For each of these elements, the policy monitor shall r
	(c) Core Requirements. On-site policy monitoring focuses on the six core requirements of the Fair Defense Act and related rules. Pol-icy monitoring may also include a review of statutorily required reports to the Office of Court Administration and Commission. This rule estab-lishes the process for evaluating policy compliance with a requirement and sets benchmarks for determining whether a county is in substantial policy compliance with the requirement. For each of these elements, the policy monitor shall r
	(c) Core Requirements. On-site policy monitoring focuses on the six core requirements of the Fair Defense Act and related rules. Pol-icy monitoring may also include a review of statutorily required reports to the Office of Court Administration and Commission. This rule estab-lishes the process for evaluating policy compliance with a requirement and sets benchmarks for determining whether a county is in substantial policy compliance with the requirement. For each of these elements, the policy monitor shall r




	shall determine if counsel was appointed within five working days of service of the petition on the juvenile. (B) A county is presumed to be in substantial compli-ance with the prompt appointment of counsel requirement if, in each level of proceedings (felony, misdemeanor, and juvenile cases), at least 90% of appointments of counsel and denials of indigence determina-tions in the policy monitor's sample are timely. (5) Attorney Selection Process. The policy monitor shall check for documentation indicating: 
	The county may request the director to grant an extension of up to 30 days. (4) Failure to Respond to Report. If a county fails to re-spond to a monitoring report or follow-up report within the required time, then a certified letter will be sent to the authorized official, fi-nancial officer, county judge, local administrative district court judge, local administrative statutory county court judge, and chair of the ju-venile board notifying them that all further payments will be withheld if no response to a

	1. The proposed repeal does not create or eliminate a govern-ment program but relates to changes to an existing activity, pre-vious participation reviews. 2. The proposed repeal does not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions. 3. The proposed repeal does not require additional future leg-islative appropriations. 4. The proposed repeal will n
	1. The proposed repeal does not create or eliminate a govern-ment program but relates to changes to an existing activity, pre-vious participation reviews. 2. The proposed repeal does not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions. 3. The proposed repeal does not require additional future leg-islative appropriations. 4. The proposed repeal will n
	1. The proposed repeal does not create or eliminate a govern-ment program but relates to changes to an existing activity, pre-vious participation reviews. 2. The proposed repeal does not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions. 3. The proposed repeal does not require additional future leg-islative appropriations. 4. The proposed repeal will n
	1. The proposed repeal does not create or eliminate a govern-ment program but relates to changes to an existing activity, pre-vious participation reviews. 2. The proposed repeal does not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions. 3. The proposed repeal does not require additional future leg-islative appropriations. 4. The proposed repeal will n
	1. The proposed repeal does not create or eliminate a govern-ment program but relates to changes to an existing activity, pre-vious participation reviews. 2. The proposed repeal does not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions. 3. The proposed repeal does not require additional future leg-islative appropriations. 4. The proposed repeal will n


	Attn: Patricia Murphy, Rule Comments, P.O. Box 13941, Austin, Texas 78711-3941 or email patricia.murphy@tdhca.state.tx.us. ALL COMMENTS MUST BE RECEIVED BY 5:00 p.m., Austin local time, March 2, 2020. STATUTORY AUTHORITY. The proposed repeal is made pur-suant to Tex. Gov't Code §2306.053, which authorizes the De-partment to adopt rules. Except as described herein the proposed amended sections af-fect no other code, article, or statute. §1.301. Previous Participation Reviews for Multifamily Awards and Owners
	Attn: Patricia Murphy, Rule Comments, P.O. Box 13941, Austin, Texas 78711-3941 or email patricia.murphy@tdhca.state.tx.us. ALL COMMENTS MUST BE RECEIVED BY 5:00 p.m., Austin local time, March 2, 2020. STATUTORY AUTHORITY. The proposed repeal is made pur-suant to Tex. Gov't Code §2306.053, which authorizes the De-partment to adopt rules. Except as described herein the proposed amended sections af-fect no other code, article, or statute. §1.301. Previous Participation Reviews for Multifamily Awards and Owners
	ParagraphSpan
	Link



	Mr. Bobby Wilkinson has determined that, for the first five years the proposed new sections would be in effect: 1. The proposed new sections do not create or eliminate a gov-ernment program but relate to changes to an existing activity: previous participation reviews. 2. The proposed new sections do not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions
	Mr. Bobby Wilkinson has determined that, for the first five years the proposed new sections would be in effect: 1. The proposed new sections do not create or eliminate a gov-ernment program but relate to changes to an existing activity: previous participation reviews. 2. The proposed new sections do not require a change in work that would require the creation of new employee positions, nor are the rule changes significant enough to reduce work load to a degree that eliminates any existing employee positions
	REQUEST FOR PUBLIC COMMENT. The public comment pe-riod will be held January 31, 2020, to March 2, 2020, to receive input on the proposed new sections. Written comments may be submitted to the Texas Department of Housing and Com-munity Affairs, Attn: Patricia Murphy, Rule Comments, P.O. Box 13941, Austin, Texas 78711-3941 or email patricia.murphy@td-hca.state.tx.us. ALL COMMENTS MUST BE RECEIVED BY 5:00 p.m., Austin local time, March 2, 2020. STATUTORY AUTHORITY. The proposed new sections are made pursuant t
	P
	Link
	Link



	(6) Events of Noncompliance--Any event for which a mul-tifamily rental Development may be found to be in noncompliance for compliance monitoring purposes as further provided for in §10.803 of this Title or in the table provided at §10.625 of this Title (relating to Events of Noncompliance). (7) Monitoring Event--An onsite or desk monitoring re-view, a Uniform Physical Condition Standards inspection, the submis-sion of the Annual Owner's Compliance Report, Final Construction In-spection, a Written Policies a
	(6) Events of Noncompliance--Any event for which a mul-tifamily rental Development may be found to be in noncompliance for compliance monitoring purposes as further provided for in §10.803 of this Title or in the table provided at §10.625 of this Title (relating to Events of Noncompliance). (7) Monitoring Event--An onsite or desk monitoring re-view, a Uniform Physical Condition Standards inspection, the submis-sion of the Annual Owner's Compliance Report, Final Construction In-spection, a Written Policies a
	(6) Events of Noncompliance--Any event for which a mul-tifamily rental Development may be found to be in noncompliance for compliance monitoring purposes as further provided for in §10.803 of this Title or in the table provided at §10.625 of this Title (relating to Events of Noncompliance). (7) Monitoring Event--An onsite or desk monitoring re-view, a Uniform Physical Condition Standards inspection, the submis-sion of the Annual Owner's Compliance Report, Final Construction In-spection, a Written Policies a
	(6) Events of Noncompliance--Any event for which a mul-tifamily rental Development may be found to be in noncompliance for compliance monitoring purposes as further provided for in §10.803 of this Title or in the table provided at §10.625 of this Title (relating to Events of Noncompliance). (7) Monitoring Event--An onsite or desk monitoring re-view, a Uniform Physical Condition Standards inspection, the submis-sion of the Annual Owner's Compliance Report, Final Construction In-spection, a Written Policies a
	(6) Events of Noncompliance--Any event for which a mul-tifamily rental Development may be found to be in noncompliance for compliance monitoring purposes as further provided for in §10.803 of this Title or in the table provided at §10.625 of this Title (relating to Events of Noncompliance). (7) Monitoring Event--An onsite or desk monitoring re-view, a Uniform Physical Condition Standards inspection, the submis-sion of the Annual Owner's Compliance Report, Final Construction In-spection, a Written Policies a
	(6) Events of Noncompliance--Any event for which a mul-tifamily rental Development may be found to be in noncompliance for compliance monitoring purposes as further provided for in §10.803 of this Title or in the table provided at §10.625 of this Title (relating to Events of Noncompliance). (7) Monitoring Event--An onsite or desk monitoring re-view, a Uniform Physical Condition Standards inspection, the submis-sion of the Annual Owner's Compliance Report, Final Construction In-spection, a Written Policies a



	will not be taken into consideration under Subsection (e)(2)(C) and (e)(3)(C) of this Section; and (10) Events of Noncompliance precluded from considera-tion by Tex. Gov't Code §2306.6719(e). (d) Applicant Process. Persons affiliated with an Application or an Ownership Transfer request must complete the Department's Uni-form Previous Participation Review Form and respond timely to staff inquiries regarding apparent errors or omissions, but for Applications no later than the Administrative Deficiency deadlin
	will not be taken into consideration under Subsection (e)(2)(C) and (e)(3)(C) of this Section; and (10) Events of Noncompliance precluded from considera-tion by Tex. Gov't Code §2306.6719(e). (d) Applicant Process. Persons affiliated with an Application or an Ownership Transfer request must complete the Department's Uni-form Previous Participation Review Form and respond timely to staff inquiries regarding apparent errors or omissions, but for Applications no later than the Administrative Deficiency deadlin


	uploaded to CMTS or submitted during the seven day period referenced in Subsection (f) of this Section will be reviewed and the Category determination may change as appropriate; (C) Within the three years immediately preceding the date of Application, any Person subject to previous participation review failed to respond during the Corrective Action Period for more than three Monitoring Events; (D) Any Development Controlled by the Applicant has been the subject of an agreed final order entered by the Board 
	uploaded to CMTS or submitted during the seven day period referenced in Subsection (f) of this Section will be reviewed and the Category determination may change as appropriate; (C) Within the three years immediately preceding the date of Application, any Person subject to previous participation review failed to respond during the Corrective Action Period for more than three Monitoring Events; (D) Any Development Controlled by the Applicant has been the subject of an agreed final order entered by the Board 

	(2) Category 1. The compliance history of Category 1 ap-plications will be deemed acceptable (for Compliance purposes only) without further review or discussion. (3) Category 2 and Category 3. Category 2 and 3 Appli-cants will be informed by the Compliance Division that the Application is a Category 2 or 3 and provided a seven calendar day period to provide written comment, submit any remaining evidence of corrective action for uncorrected events, propose one or more of the conditions listed in §1.303 of th
	(2) Category 1. The compliance history of Category 1 ap-plications will be deemed acceptable (for Compliance purposes only) without further review or discussion. (3) Category 2 and Category 3. Category 2 and 3 Appli-cants will be informed by the Compliance Division that the Application is a Category 2 or 3 and provided a seven calendar day period to provide written comment, submit any remaining evidence of corrective action for uncorrected events, propose one or more of the conditions listed in §1.303 of th
	(2) Category 1. The compliance history of Category 1 ap-plications will be deemed acceptable (for Compliance purposes only) without further review or discussion. (3) Category 2 and Category 3. Category 2 and 3 Appli-cants will be informed by the Compliance Division that the Application is a Category 2 or 3 and provided a seven calendar day period to provide written comment, submit any remaining evidence of corrective action for uncorrected events, propose one or more of the conditions listed in §1.303 of th
	(2) Category 1. The compliance history of Category 1 ap-plications will be deemed acceptable (for Compliance purposes only) without further review or discussion. (3) Category 2 and Category 3. Category 2 and 3 Appli-cants will be informed by the Compliance Division that the Application is a Category 2 or 3 and provided a seven calendar day period to provide written comment, submit any remaining evidence of corrective action for uncorrected events, propose one or more of the conditions listed in §1.303 of th




	funds or a Contract. As used in this Section, the term Single Audit relates specifically to the audit required by 2 CFR §200.501 or UGMS Subpart E. (c) Upon Department request, Applicant will be required to submit: (1) A listing of the members of its board of directors, coun-cil, or other governing body as applicable or certification that the same relevant information has been submitted in accordance with §1.22 of this Subchapter (relating to Providing Contact Information to the De-partment), and if applica
	funds or a Contract. As used in this Section, the term Single Audit relates specifically to the audit required by 2 CFR §200.501 or UGMS Subpart E. (c) Upon Department request, Applicant will be required to submit: (1) A listing of the members of its board of directors, coun-cil, or other governing body as applicable or certification that the same relevant information has been submitted in accordance with §1.22 of this Subchapter (relating to Providing Contact Information to the De-partment), and if applica
	funds or a Contract. As used in this Section, the term Single Audit relates specifically to the audit required by 2 CFR §200.501 or UGMS Subpart E. (c) Upon Department request, Applicant will be required to submit: (1) A listing of the members of its board of directors, coun-cil, or other governing body as applicable or certification that the same relevant information has been submitted in accordance with §1.22 of this Subchapter (relating to Providing Contact Information to the De-partment), and if applica
	funds or a Contract. As used in this Section, the term Single Audit relates specifically to the audit required by 2 CFR §200.501 or UGMS Subpart E. (c) Upon Department request, Applicant will be required to submit: (1) A listing of the members of its board of directors, coun-cil, or other governing body as applicable or certification that the same relevant information has been submitted in accordance with §1.22 of this Subchapter (relating to Providing Contact Information to the De-partment), and if applica

	(3) Issues identified in Subsection (d) of this Section; (4) The Deficiencies, Findings and Concerns identified during any monitoring visits conducted within the last three years (whether or not the Findings were corrected during the Corrective Action Period); and (5) The Department's record of complaints concerning the Applicant. (g) Compliance Recommendation to EARAC. (1) If the Applicant has no history with Department pro-grams, and Compliance staff has not identified any issues with the Sin-gle Audit or
	(3) Issues identified in Subsection (d) of this Section; (4) The Deficiencies, Findings and Concerns identified during any monitoring visits conducted within the last three years (whether or not the Findings were corrected during the Corrective Action Period); and (5) The Department's record of complaints concerning the Applicant. (g) Compliance Recommendation to EARAC. (1) If the Applicant has no history with Department pro-grams, and Compliance staff has not identified any issues with the Sin-gle Audit or


	(k) For CSBG funds required to be distributed to Eligible En-tities by formula, the recommendation of the Compliance Division will only take into consideration Subsection (i) of this Section. (l) Previous Participation reviews will not be conducted for Contract Amendments that staff is authorized to approve. §1.303. Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC). (a) Authority and Purpose. The Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC) is established by Tex. Gov't Code §2306.1112 to make r
	(k) For CSBG funds required to be distributed to Eligible En-tities by formula, the recommendation of the Compliance Division will only take into consideration Subsection (i) of this Section. (l) Previous Participation reviews will not be conducted for Contract Amendments that staff is authorized to approve. §1.303. Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC). (a) Authority and Purpose. The Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC) is established by Tex. Gov't Code §2306.1112 to make r
	(k) For CSBG funds required to be distributed to Eligible En-tities by formula, the recommendation of the Compliance Division will only take into consideration Subsection (i) of this Section. (l) Previous Participation reviews will not be conducted for Contract Amendments that staff is authorized to approve. §1.303. Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC). (a) Authority and Purpose. The Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC) is established by Tex. Gov't Code §2306.1112 to make r
	(k) For CSBG funds required to be distributed to Eligible En-tities by formula, the recommendation of the Compliance Division will only take into consideration Subsection (i) of this Section. (l) Previous Participation reviews will not be conducted for Contract Amendments that staff is authorized to approve. §1.303. Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC). (a) Authority and Purpose. The Executive Award and Review Advisory Committee (EARAC) is established by Tex. Gov't Code §2306.1112 to make r



	(1) Applicant/Owner is required to ensure that each Person subject to previous participation review for the Combined Portfolio will correct all applicable issues of non-compliance identified by the previ-ous participation review on or before a specified date and provide the Department with evidence of such correction within 30 calendar days of that date. (2) Owner is required to have qualified personnel or a qual-ified third party perform a one-time review of an agreed upon percent-age of files and complete
	(1) Applicant/Owner is required to ensure that each Person subject to previous participation review for the Combined Portfolio will correct all applicable issues of non-compliance identified by the previ-ous participation review on or before a specified date and provide the Department with evidence of such correction within 30 calendar days of that date. (2) Owner is required to have qualified personnel or a qual-ified third party perform a one-time review of an agreed upon percent-age of files and complete
	(1) Applicant/Owner is required to ensure that each Person subject to previous participation review for the Combined Portfolio will correct all applicable issues of non-compliance identified by the previ-ous participation review on or before a specified date and provide the Department with evidence of such correction within 30 calendar days of that date. (2) Owner is required to have qualified personnel or a qual-ified third party perform a one-time review of an agreed upon percent-age of files and complete
	(1) Applicant/Owner is required to ensure that each Person subject to previous participation review for the Combined Portfolio will correct all applicable issues of non-compliance identified by the previ-ous participation review on or before a specified date and provide the Department with evidence of such correction within 30 calendar days of that date. (2) Owner is required to have qualified personnel or a qual-ified third party perform a one-time review of an agreed upon percent-age of files and complete




	(v) Most current Tenant Selection Criteria Presenta-tion; (vi) Most current Affirmative Marketing Require-ments Presentation; (vii) Fair Housing Webinars (including but not lim-ited to the 2017 FH webinars); (D) Training for Certified Occupancy Specialist or Blended Occupancy Specialist; or (E) Any other training deemed applicable and appropri-ate by the Department, which may include but is not limited to, weath-erization related specific trainings such as OSHA, Lead Renovator, or Building Analyst training.
	(v) Most current Tenant Selection Criteria Presenta-tion; (vi) Most current Affirmative Marketing Require-ments Presentation; (vii) Fair Housing Webinars (including but not lim-ited to the 2017 FH webinars); (D) Training for Certified Occupancy Specialist or Blended Occupancy Specialist; or (E) Any other training deemed applicable and appropri-ate by the Department, which may include but is not limited to, weath-erization related specific trainings such as OSHA, Lead Renovator, or Building Analyst training.
	(v) Most current Tenant Selection Criteria Presenta-tion; (vi) Most current Affirmative Marketing Require-ments Presentation; (vii) Fair Housing Webinars (including but not lim-ited to the 2017 FH webinars); (D) Training for Certified Occupancy Specialist or Blended Occupancy Specialist; or (E) Any other training deemed applicable and appropri-ate by the Department, which may include but is not limited to, weath-erization related specific trainings such as OSHA, Lead Renovator, or Building Analyst training.
	(v) Most current Tenant Selection Criteria Presenta-tion; (vi) Most current Affirmative Marketing Require-ments Presentation; (vii) Fair Housing Webinars (including but not lim-ited to the 2017 FH webinars); (D) Training for Certified Occupancy Specialist or Blended Occupancy Specialist; or (E) Any other training deemed applicable and appropri-ate by the Department, which may include but is not limited to, weath-erization related specific trainings such as OSHA, Lead Renovator, or Building Analyst training.
	(v) Most current Tenant Selection Criteria Presenta-tion; (vi) Most current Affirmative Marketing Require-ments Presentation; (vii) Fair Housing Webinars (including but not lim-ited to the 2017 FH webinars); (D) Training for Certified Occupancy Specialist or Blended Occupancy Specialist; or (E) Any other training deemed applicable and appropri-ate by the Department, which may include but is not limited to, weath-erization related specific trainings such as OSHA, Lead Renovator, or Building Analyst training.
	(v) Most current Tenant Selection Criteria Presenta-tion; (vi) Most current Affirmative Marketing Require-ments Presentation; (vii) Fair Housing Webinars (including but not lim-ited to the 2017 FH webinars); (D) Training for Certified Occupancy Specialist or Blended Occupancy Specialist; or (E) Any other training deemed applicable and appropri-ate by the Department, which may include but is not limited to, weath-erization related specific trainings such as OSHA, Lead Renovator, or Building Analyst training.



	(f) Failure to meet conditions. (1) The Executive Director may, for good cause and as lim-ited by federal commitment, expenditure, or other deadlines, grant one extension to a deadline specified in a condition, with no fee required, for up to six months, if requested prior to the deadline. Any subsequent extension, or extensions requested after the deadline, must be approved by the Board. (2) If any condition agreed upon by the Applicant and im-posed by the Board is not met as determined by the evidence sub
	(f) Failure to meet conditions. (1) The Executive Director may, for good cause and as lim-ited by federal commitment, expenditure, or other deadlines, grant one extension to a deadline specified in a condition, with no fee required, for up to six months, if requested prior to the deadline. Any subsequent extension, or extensions requested after the deadline, must be approved by the Board. (2) If any condition agreed upon by the Applicant and im-posed by the Board is not met as determined by the evidence sub


	matter to the Board if those materials are provided not later than close of business of the fifth calendar day before the date on which notice of the relevant Board meeting materials must be posted, allowing staff sufficient time to review the Applicant's materials and prepare a presen-tation to the Board reflecting staff's assessment and recommendation. The agenda item will include the materials provided by the Applicant and may include a staff response to the dispute and/or materials. It is within the boa
	matter to the Board if those materials are provided not later than close of business of the fifth calendar day before the date on which notice of the relevant Board meeting materials must be posted, allowing staff sufficient time to review the Applicant's materials and prepare a presen-tation to the Board reflecting staff's assessment and recommendation. The agenda item will include the materials provided by the Applicant and may include a staff response to the dispute and/or materials. It is within the boa

	which exempts rule changes necessary to protect the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of this state, and §2001.0045(c)(9), which exempts rule changes necessary to implement legislation. The Department has analyzed this proposed rulemaking and the analysis is described below for each category of analysis per-formed. a. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT RE-QUIRED BY TEX. GOV'T CODE §2001.0221. Mr. Bobby Wilkinson, Executive Director, has determined that, for the first five years the proposed rulem

	for the first five years the proposed new section would be in ef-fect there would be no economic effect on local employment; therefore, no local employment impact statement is required to be prepared for the rule. e. PUBLIC BENEFIT/COST NOTE REQUIRED BY TEX. GOV'T CODE §2001.024(a)(5). Mr. Wilkinson has determined that, for each year of the first five years the proposed new section is in effect, the public benefit anticipated as a result of the new sec-tions would be an updated and more germane rule. There 
	for the first five years the proposed new section would be in ef-fect there would be no economic effect on local employment; therefore, no local employment impact statement is required to be prepared for the rule. e. PUBLIC BENEFIT/COST NOTE REQUIRED BY TEX. GOV'T CODE §2001.024(a)(5). Mr. Wilkinson has determined that, for each year of the first five years the proposed new section is in effect, the public benefit anticipated as a result of the new sec-tions would be an updated and more germane rule. There 
	for the first five years the proposed new section would be in ef-fect there would be no economic effect on local employment; therefore, no local employment impact statement is required to be prepared for the rule. e. PUBLIC BENEFIT/COST NOTE REQUIRED BY TEX. GOV'T CODE §2001.024(a)(5). Mr. Wilkinson has determined that, for each year of the first five years the proposed new section is in effect, the public benefit anticipated as a result of the new sec-tions would be an updated and more germane rule. There 
	P
	Link

	TITLE 16. ECONOMIC REGULATION PART 2. PUBLIC UTILITY COMMISSION OF TEXAS CHAPTER 25. SUBSTANTIVE RULES APPLICABLE TO ELECTRIC SERVICE PROVIDERS SUBCHAPTER R. CUSTOMER PROTECTION RULES FOR RETAIL ELECTRIC SERVICE 16 TAC §25.471 The Public Utility Commission of Texas (commission) proposes amendments to §25.471, relating to general provisions of cus-tomer protection rules. The proposed amendments will clarify that, where specifically stated, Chapter 25, Subchapter R, Gen-eral Provisions of Customer Protection 

	The commission has determined that the proposed rule will not be a taking of private property as defined in chapter 2007 of the Texas Government Code. Fiscal Impact on State and Local Government Cliff Crouch, Manager of Licensing and Compliance, Customer Protection Division, has determined that for the first five-year pe-riod the proposed amendments are in effect, there will be no fiscal implications for the state or for units of local government under Texas Government Code §2001.024(a)(4) as a result of en
	The commission has determined that the proposed rule will not be a taking of private property as defined in chapter 2007 of the Texas Government Code. Fiscal Impact on State and Local Government Cliff Crouch, Manager of Licensing and Compliance, Customer Protection Division, has determined that for the first five-year pe-riod the proposed amendments are in effect, there will be no fiscal implications for the state or for units of local government under Texas Government Code §2001.024(a)(4) as a result of en
	§39.3555, which requires entities that register as brokers with the commission to comply with customer protection provisions, disclosure requirements, and marketing guidelines established by the commission. Cross reference to statutes: Public Utility Regulatory Act §§14.002 and 39.3555. §25.471. General Provisions of Customer Protection Rules. (a) Application. This subchapter applies to aggregators and retail electric providers (REPs). In addition, where specifically stated, these rules [shall] apply to tra
	§39.3555, which requires entities that register as brokers with the commission to comply with customer protection provisions, disclosure requirements, and marketing guidelines established by the commission. Cross reference to statutes: Public Utility Regulatory Act §§14.002 and 39.3555. §25.471. General Provisions of Customer Protection Rules. (a) Application. This subchapter applies to aggregators and retail electric providers (REPs). In addition, where specifically stated, these rules [shall] apply to tra



	The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 17, 2020. TRD-202000214 Andrea Gonzalez Rules Coordinator Public Utility Commission of Texas Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 658-1138 ♦ ♦ ♦ PART 4. TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATION CHAPTER 65. BOILERS The Texas Department of Licensing and Re
	The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 17, 2020. TRD-202000214 Andrea Gonzalez Rules Coordinator Public Utility Commission of Texas Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 658-1138 ♦ ♦ ♦ PART 4. TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATION CHAPTER 65. BOILERS The Texas Department of Licensing and Re
	The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 17, 2020. TRD-202000214 Andrea Gonzalez Rules Coordinator Public Utility Commission of Texas Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 658-1138 ♦ ♦ ♦ PART 4. TEXAS DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATION CHAPTER 65. BOILERS The Texas Department of Licensing and Re
	The amendments to §65.206 update the name of the section to reflect its increased scope and add the requirement for a CO detector and interlock system to disable the burners of any CO-producing boiler if the concentration of CO in the boiler room reaches a dangerous level. The amendments also specify applicability and update citations. The section is renumbered accordingly. The amendments to §65.214 update wording for a modular boiler requirement consistent with the revised definition of Modular Boiler, and

	CO poisoning, the benefits to the public of the new interlock requirement will include reduced hospitalizations and medical expenses, and reduced need for emergency response services. Multiple edits in the amended sections including updates, cor-rections, and improved word choices make the boiler rules more understandable and easier to use. These improvements and the increased clarity of the updated boiler room ventilation require-ments will facilitate easier compliance with these requirements by the affect
	and breweries. Implementation of the proposed rules would re-quire all boiler rooms with new or reinstalled CO-producing boil-ers to be equipped with a CO detector that will shut off all CO-pro-ducing boilers in the room if the concentration of CO in the boiler room exceeds 50 parts per million (the Occupational Health and Safety Administration permissible exposure limit). The anticipated cost to purchase and install a CO detector inter-lock system is estimated to be approximately $1,000 per boiler room (ap
	and breweries. Implementation of the proposed rules would re-quire all boiler rooms with new or reinstalled CO-producing boil-ers to be equipped with a CO detector that will shut off all CO-pro-ducing boilers in the room if the concentration of CO in the boiler room exceeds 50 parts per million (the Occupational Health and Safety Administration permissible exposure limit). The anticipated cost to purchase and install a CO detector inter-lock system is estimated to be approximately $1,000 per boiler room (ap


	tem. However, the proposed rules falls under the exception for rules that are necessary to protect the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of this state under §2001.0045(c)(6). Because of the applicable exception the agency is not required to take any further action under Government Code §2001.0045. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Pursuant to Government Code §2001.0221, the agency provides the following Government Growth Impact Statement for the pro-posed rules. For each year of the first five y
	tem. However, the proposed rules falls under the exception for rules that are necessary to protect the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of this state under §2001.0045(c)(6). Because of the applicable exception the agency is not required to take any further action under Government Code §2001.0045. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Pursuant to Government Code §2001.0221, the agency provides the following Government Growth Impact Statement for the pro-posed rules. For each year of the first five y
	tem. However, the proposed rules falls under the exception for rules that are necessary to protect the health, safety, and welfare of the residents of this state under §2001.0045(c)(6). Because of the applicable exception the agency is not required to take any further action under Government Code §2001.0045. GOVERNMENT GROWTH IMPACT STATEMENT Pursuant to Government Code §2001.0221, the agency provides the following Government Growth Impact Statement for the pro-posed rules. For each year of the first five y
	P
	Link
	Link

	The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law establishing a program regulated by the Department. The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No o
	The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law establishing a program regulated by the Department. The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No o
	The proposed rules are proposed under Texas Occupations Code, Chapter 51, and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755, which authorize the Texas Commission of Licensing and Regulation, the Department's governing body, to adopt rules as necessary to implement these chapters and any other law establishing a program regulated by the Department. The statutory provisions affected by the proposed rules are those set forth in Texas Occupations Code, Chapters 51 and Texas Health and Safety Code, Chapter 755. No o





	(1) The owner or operator may request a Temporary Boiler Operating Permit on a department-approved form. (2) The owner or operator must pay the applicable fee provided [required] under §65.300. (3) Upon approval of the Temporary Boiler Operating Per-mit from the department, the boiler may be operated prior to the re-quired initial inspection for up to thirty (30) days. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Fi
	(1) The owner or operator may request a Temporary Boiler Operating Permit on a department-approved form. (2) The owner or operator must pay the applicable fee provided [required] under §65.300. (3) Upon approval of the Temporary Boiler Operating Per-mit from the department, the boiler may be operated prior to the re-quired initial inspection for up to thirty (30) days. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Fi
	(1) The owner or operator may request a Temporary Boiler Operating Permit on a department-approved form. (2) The owner or operator must pay the applicable fee provided [required] under §65.300. (3) Upon approval of the Temporary Boiler Operating Per-mit from the department, the boiler may be operated prior to the re-quired initial inspection for up to thirty (30) days. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Fi
	(1) The owner or operator may request a Temporary Boiler Operating Permit on a department-approved form. (2) The owner or operator must pay the applicable fee provided [required] under §65.300. (3) Upon approval of the Temporary Boiler Operating Per-mit from the department, the boiler may be operated prior to the re-quired initial inspection for up to thirty (30) days. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Fi
	(1) The owner or operator may request a Temporary Boiler Operating Permit on a department-approved form. (2) The owner or operator must pay the applicable fee provided [required] under §65.300. (3) Upon approval of the Temporary Boiler Operating Per-mit from the department, the boiler may be operated prior to the re-quired initial inspection for up to thirty (30) days. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Fi



	(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. (e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. (f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. (g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. (h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, Care and Operation 
	(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. (e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. (f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. (g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. (h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, Care and Operation 
	(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. (e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. (f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. (g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. (h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, Care and Operation 
	(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. (e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. (f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. (g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. (h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, Care and Operation 
	(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. (e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. (f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. (g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. (h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, Care and Operation 
	(d) [(c)] The roof over boilers designed for indoor installa-tions, shall be free from leaks and maintained in good condition. (e) [(d)] Adequate drainage shall be provided. (f) [(e)] All exit doors shall open outward. (g) [(f)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VI, Care and Operation of Heating Boilers, [covering the care and opera-tion of heating boilers] be used as a guide for proper and safe operating practices. (h) [(g)] It is recommended that the ASME Code, Section VII, Care and Operation 





	(e) Authorized Inspection Agency[/]Letter of Recognition. The Authorized [authorized] Inspection Agency shall make payment for the following fees: (1) Initial [Original] Application--$100 (2) (No change.) (f) -(j) (No change.) (k) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit Fee. The owner or op-erator shall make a $50 fee payment. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on 
	(e) Authorized Inspection Agency[/]Letter of Recognition. The Authorized [authorized] Inspection Agency shall make payment for the following fees: (1) Initial [Original] Application--$100 (2) (No change.) (f) -(j) (No change.) (k) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit Fee. The owner or op-erator shall make a $50 fee payment. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on 
	(e) Authorized Inspection Agency[/]Letter of Recognition. The Authorized [authorized] Inspection Agency shall make payment for the following fees: (1) Initial [Original] Application--$100 (2) (No change.) (f) -(j) (No change.) (k) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit Fee. The owner or op-erator shall make a $50 fee payment. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on 
	(e) Authorized Inspection Agency[/]Letter of Recognition. The Authorized [authorized] Inspection Agency shall make payment for the following fees: (1) Initial [Original] Application--$100 (2) (No change.) (f) -(j) (No change.) (k) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit Fee. The owner or op-erator shall make a $50 fee payment. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on 
	(e) Authorized Inspection Agency[/]Letter of Recognition. The Authorized [authorized] Inspection Agency shall make payment for the following fees: (1) Initial [Original] Application--$100 (2) (No change.) (f) -(j) (No change.) (k) Temporary Boiler Operating Permit Fee. The owner or op-erator shall make a $50 fee payment. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on 



	(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. (4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pr
	(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. (4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pr
	(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. (4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pr
	(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. (4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pr
	(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. (4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pr
	(3) [(2)] The power ventilator or fans shall be sized on the basis of 0.2 cfm. (5.6 liters per minute) for each 1,000 Btu/hour (.29 kilowatts) fuel input for the combined burners located in the boiler room. The boiler and the fans shall be interlocked to disable [so that] the burners [will not operate] unless a supply of combustion, venti-lation, and dilution air in accordance with [as required by] the boiler manufacturer's recommendations is maintained. (4) Power ventilators or fans designed to maintain pr




	TRD-202000199 Brad Bowman General Counsel Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 463-8179 ♦ ♦ ♦ TITLE 30. ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY PART 1. TEXAS COMMISSION ON ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY CHAPTER 114. CONTROL OF AIR POLLUTION FROM MOTOR VEHICLES SUBCHAPTER K. MOBILE SOURCE INCENTIVE PROGRAMS DIVISION 3. DIESEL EMISSIONS REDUCTION INCENTIVE PROGRAM FOR ON-ROAD AND NON-ROAD VEHICLES 30 TAC §114.622, §114.629 The Texas Co
	The commission proposes to amend §114.622(b) and (c) to change the minimum percentage of usage in a nonattainment area or affected county from 75% to 55% to implement HB 1346. §114.629, Affected Counties and Implementation Schedule The commission proposes to amend §114.629(a) to remove Vic-toria County from the list of affected counties eligible for grants under the TERP DERIP to implement HB 1627. Fiscal Note: Costs to State and Local Government Jené Bearse, Analyst in the Budget and Planning Division, de-
	The commission proposes to amend §114.622(b) and (c) to change the minimum percentage of usage in a nonattainment area or affected county from 75% to 55% to implement HB 1346. §114.629, Affected Counties and Implementation Schedule The commission proposes to amend §114.629(a) to remove Vic-toria County from the list of affected counties eligible for grants under the TERP DERIP to implement HB 1627. Fiscal Note: Costs to State and Local Government Jené Bearse, Analyst in the Budget and Planning Division, de-



	The commission reviewed this proposed rulemaking and deter-mined that a Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis is not required because the proposed rulemaking does not adversely affect a small or micro-business in a material way for the first five years the proposed rules are in effect. Government Growth Impact Statement The commission prepared a Government Growth Impact State-ment assessment for this proposed rulemaking. The proposed rulemaking does not create or eliminate a government program and 
	The commission reviewed this proposed rulemaking and deter-mined that a Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis is not required because the proposed rulemaking does not adversely affect a small or micro-business in a material way for the first five years the proposed rules are in effect. Government Growth Impact Statement The commission prepared a Government Growth Impact State-ment assessment for this proposed rulemaking. The proposed rulemaking does not create or eliminate a government program and 
	The commission reviewed this proposed rulemaking and deter-mined that a Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis is not required because the proposed rulemaking does not adversely affect a small or micro-business in a material way for the first five years the proposed rules are in effect. Government Growth Impact Statement The commission prepared a Government Growth Impact State-ment assessment for this proposed rulemaking. The proposed rulemaking does not create or eliminate a government program and 
	Authority section of this preamble. Therefore, this rulemaking is not subject to the regulatory analysis provisions of Texas Gov-ernment Code, §2001.0225(b). Written comments on the Draft Regulatory Impact Analysis De-termination may be submitted to the contact person at the ad-dress listed under the Submittal of Comments section of this pre-amble. Takings Impact Assessment The commission evaluated the proposed rulemaking and per-formed an analysis of whether the proposed rulemaking consti-tutes a taking un
	Authority section of this preamble. Therefore, this rulemaking is not subject to the regulatory analysis provisions of Texas Gov-ernment Code, §2001.0225(b). Written comments on the Draft Regulatory Impact Analysis De-termination may be submitted to the contact person at the ad-dress listed under the Submittal of Comments section of this pre-amble. Takings Impact Assessment The commission evaluated the proposed rulemaking and per-formed an analysis of whether the proposed rulemaking consti-tutes a taking un


	Written comments on the consistency of this rulemaking may be submitted to the contact person at the address listed under the Submittal of Comments section of this preamble. Announcement of Hearing The commission will hold a public hearing on this proposal in Austin on February 25, 2020, at 10:00 a.m. in Building E, Room 201S, at the commission's central office located at 12100 Park 35 Circle. The hearing is structured for the receipt of oral or writ-ten comments by interested persons. Individuals may prese
	P
	Link
	Link

	(3) emissions-reducing repower projects for on-road or non-road diesels; (4) purchase and use of emissions-reducing add-on equip-ment for on-road or non-road diesels; (5) development and demonstration of practical, low-emis-sions retrofit technologies, repower options, and advanced technolo-gies for on-road or non-road diesels with lower nitrogen oxides (NOX) emissions; (6) use of qualifying fuel; (7) implementation of infrastructure projects; (8) replacement of on-road and non-road diesels with newer on-ro
	(3) emissions-reducing repower projects for on-road or non-road diesels; (4) purchase and use of emissions-reducing add-on equip-ment for on-road or non-road diesels; (5) development and demonstration of practical, low-emis-sions retrofit technologies, repower options, and advanced technolo-gies for on-road or non-road diesels with lower nitrogen oxides (NOX) emissions; (6) use of qualifying fuel; (7) implementation of infrastructure projects; (8) replacement of on-road and non-road diesels with newer on-ro
	(3) emissions-reducing repower projects for on-road or non-road diesels; (4) purchase and use of emissions-reducing add-on equip-ment for on-road or non-road diesels; (5) development and demonstration of practical, low-emis-sions retrofit technologies, repower options, and advanced technolo-gies for on-road or non-road diesels with lower nitrogen oxides (NOX) emissions; (6) use of qualifying fuel; (7) implementation of infrastructure projects; (8) replacement of on-road and non-road diesels with newer on-ro



	replace and recycle or scrap the vehicle and engine before a grant is awarded for that project. (g) The commission may set cost-effectiveness limits as needed to ensure the best use of available funds. The commission may also base project selection decisions on additional measures to evaluate the effectiveness of projects in reducing NOemissions in relation to the funds to beawarded.X   (h) The executive director may waive eligibility requirements established under subsections (b) -(f) of this section on a 
	replace and recycle or scrap the vehicle and engine before a grant is awarded for that project. (g) The commission may set cost-effectiveness limits as needed to ensure the best use of available funds. The commission may also base project selection decisions on additional measures to evaluate the effectiveness of projects in reducing NOemissions in relation to the funds to beawarded.X   (h) The executive director may waive eligibility requirements established under subsections (b) -(f) of this section on a 
	replace and recycle or scrap the vehicle and engine before a grant is awarded for that project. (g) The commission may set cost-effectiveness limits as needed to ensure the best use of available funds. The commission may also base project selection decisions on additional measures to evaluate the effectiveness of projects in reducing NOemissions in relation to the funds to beawarded.X   (h) The executive director may waive eligibility requirements established under subsections (b) -(f) of this section on a 
	Denton, El Paso, Ellis, Fort Bend, Galveston, Gregg, Guadalupe, Hardin, Harris, [Hardin,] Harrison, Hays, Henderson, Hood, Hunt, Jefferson, Johnson, Kaufman, Liberty, Montgomery, Nueces, Orange, Parker, Rockwall, Rusk, San Patricio, Smith, Tarrant, Travis, Upshur, [Victoria,] Waller, Williamson, Wilson, Wise, and any other county located within an area of Texas designated as a nonattainment area for ground-level ozone under Federal Clean Air Act, §107(d), as amended. (b) Equipment purchased before September
	Denton, El Paso, Ellis, Fort Bend, Galveston, Gregg, Guadalupe, Hardin, Harris, [Hardin,] Harrison, Hays, Henderson, Hood, Hunt, Jefferson, Johnson, Kaufman, Liberty, Montgomery, Nueces, Orange, Parker, Rockwall, Rusk, San Patricio, Smith, Tarrant, Travis, Upshur, [Victoria,] Waller, Williamson, Wilson, Wise, and any other county located within an area of Texas designated as a nonattainment area for ground-level ozone under Federal Clean Air Act, §107(d), as amended. (b) Equipment purchased before September


	§328.200, Purpose The commission proposes new §328.200 which would pertain to governmental entities and establish a standard to implement a recycling program. §328.201, Definitions The commission proposes new §328.201 to define governmen-tal entity, hardship, and recyclable materials within the context of the requirements. §328.202, General Requirements The commission proposes new §328.202 to describe the respon-sibilities for governmental entities to establish a recycling pro-gram. Overall, the entity must
	§328.200, Purpose The commission proposes new §328.200 which would pertain to governmental entities and establish a standard to implement a recycling program. §328.201, Definitions The commission proposes new §328.201 to define governmen-tal entity, hardship, and recyclable materials within the context of the requirements. §328.202, General Requirements The commission proposes new §328.202 to describe the respon-sibilities for governmental entities to establish a recycling pro-gram. Overall, the entity must
	posed rules and the associated state law is shown to create a hardship. Small Business and Micro-Business Assessment No adverse fiscal implications are anticipated for small or mi-cro-businesses due to the implementation or administration of the proposed rules for the first five-year period the proposed rule-making is in effect. Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis The commission reviewed this proposed rulemaking and deter-mined that a Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis is not required
	posed rules and the associated state law is shown to create a hardship. Small Business and Micro-Business Assessment No adverse fiscal implications are anticipated for small or mi-cro-businesses due to the implementation or administration of the proposed rules for the first five-year period the proposed rule-making is in effect. Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis The commission reviewed this proposed rulemaking and deter-mined that a Small Business Regulatory Flexibility Analysis is not required



	2) exceed an express requirement of state law, unless the rule is specifically required by federal law; 3) exceed a requirement of a delegation agreement or contract between the state and an agency or representative of the federal government to implement a state and federal program, or; 4) adopt a rule solely under the general authority of the commission. Proposed new §§328.200 -328.204 do not exceed an express requirement of state law, fed-eral law, or a requirement of a delegation agreement and were not d
	2) exceed an express requirement of state law, unless the rule is specifically required by federal law; 3) exceed a requirement of a delegation agreement or contract between the state and an agency or representative of the federal government to implement a state and federal program, or; 4) adopt a rule solely under the general authority of the commission. Proposed new §§328.200 -328.204 do not exceed an express requirement of state law, fed-eral law, or a requirement of a delegation agreement and were not d
	2) exceed an express requirement of state law, unless the rule is specifically required by federal law; 3) exceed a requirement of a delegation agreement or contract between the state and an agency or representative of the federal government to implement a state and federal program, or; 4) adopt a rule solely under the general authority of the commission. Proposed new §§328.200 -328.204 do not exceed an express requirement of state law, fed-eral law, or a requirement of a delegation agreement and were not d
	Written comments on the consistency of this rulemaking may be submitted to the contact person at the address listed under the Submittal of Comments section of this preamble. Effect on Sites Subject to the Federal Operating Permits Pro-gram This rulemaking is not subject to requirements of the Federal Operating Permit program. Announcement of Hearing The commission will hold a public hearing on this proposal in Austin on February 27, 2020, at 10:00 a.m. in Building E, Room 201S, at the commission's central o
	P
	Link
	Link


	§328.201. Definitions. The following terms, when used in this subchapter, shall have the fol-lowing meanings. (1) Governmental entity--A state agency, state court or ju-dicial agency, a university system or institution of higher education, a county, municipality, school district, or special district. (2) Hardship--A circumstance that causes unreasonable burden on the governmental entity. (3) Recyclable material--A material generated by the en-tity's operations, including aluminum, steel containers, aseptic 
	§328.201. Definitions. The following terms, when used in this subchapter, shall have the fol-lowing meanings. (1) Governmental entity--A state agency, state court or ju-dicial agency, a university system or institution of higher education, a county, municipality, school district, or special district. (2) Hardship--A circumstance that causes unreasonable burden on the governmental entity. (3) Recyclable material--A material generated by the en-tity's operations, including aluminum, steel containers, aseptic 

	TRD-202000169 Robert Martinez Director, Environmental Law Division Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 293-1806 ♦ ♦ ♦ CHAPTER 344. LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION The Texas Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ, agency, or commission) proposes to amend §§344.1, 344.20 -344.22, 344.24, 344.30, 344.31, 344.33 -344.38, 344.40, 344.42, 344.43, 344.50 -344.52, 344.60 -344.65, 344.70 -344.72, and 344.80; to repeal §344.32

	These proposed revisions would strengthen the rules and pro-vide for increased protection of the public health and increased water conservation. In addition, this rulemaking would align terms and definitions in this chapter with those in other, relevant chapters of 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC). Specifically, definitions are proposed to be amended to align with 30 TAC Chapter 290, Public Drinking Water. Section by Section Discussion The commission proposes to make various stylistic, non-sub-stantive ch
	These proposed revisions would strengthen the rules and pro-vide for increased protection of the public health and increased water conservation. In addition, this rulemaking would align terms and definitions in this chapter with those in other, relevant chapters of 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC). Specifically, definitions are proposed to be amended to align with 30 TAC Chapter 290, Public Drinking Water. Section by Section Discussion The commission proposes to make various stylistic, non-sub-stantive ch
	These proposed revisions would strengthen the rules and pro-vide for increased protection of the public health and increased water conservation. In addition, this rulemaking would align terms and definitions in this chapter with those in other, relevant chapters of 30 Texas Administrative Code (TAC). Specifically, definitions are proposed to be amended to align with 30 TAC Chapter 290, Public Drinking Water. Section by Section Discussion The commission proposes to make various stylistic, non-sub-stantive ch
	classification of all landscape irrigation as a health hazard. Lo-cal programs may elect to restrict usage of these devices. The commission proposes to amend the definition of "Employed" in §344.1(12) to reference the amended definition of "Irrigation services" in §344.1(20) rather than "consulting services or per-form any activity relating to the sale, design, installation, main-tenance, alteration, repair, or service to irrigation systems." The commission proposes to add a definition for "Exempt busi-ness
	classification of all landscape irrigation as a health hazard. Lo-cal programs may elect to restrict usage of these devices. The commission proposes to amend the definition of "Employed" in §344.1(12) to reference the amended definition of "Irrigation services" in §344.1(20) rather than "consulting services or per-form any activity relating to the sale, design, installation, main-tenance, alteration, repair, or service to irrigation systems." The commission proposes to add a definition for "Exempt busi-ness


	The commission proposes to amend the definition for "Irrigation technician" in §344.1(22), to improve clarity and to add the term "irrigation services" in place of the list of services, "install, main-tain, alter, repair, service or supervise installation of an irrigation system." This is consistent with the proposed amended defini-tion of "Irrigation services." The commission proposes to amend the definition for "Irrigation zone" in §344.1(23) to improve clarity. The commission proposes to amend the defini
	The commission proposes to amend §344.20(b) to remove the word "installer" as it is no longer a recognized TCEQ licensed individual and to replace the word "should" with "shall" to better reflect the mandatory nature of this rule. §344.21, Intent The commission proposes to amend §344.21(a) to remove the word "installer" because it is no longer a recognized TCEQ li-censed individual. The commission proposes §344.21(c) to address exemptions for on-site sewage systems, agricultural irrigation, and irrigation s

	The commission proposes §344.30(b) (previously §344.30(c)) to remove "beginning January 1, 2009" since this date has passed and is no longer relevant. There is no change to the description of an irrigation technician. §344.31, Exemption for Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Services The commission proposes to amend the title of this section from "Exemption for Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Ser-vices" to "Responsibilities of a Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Services." The commission pro
	The commission proposes §344.30(b) (previously §344.30(c)) to remove "beginning January 1, 2009" since this date has passed and is no longer relevant. There is no change to the description of an irrigation technician. §344.31, Exemption for Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Services The commission proposes to amend the title of this section from "Exemption for Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Ser-vices" to "Responsibilities of a Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Services." The commission pro
	The commission proposes §344.30(b) (previously §344.30(c)) to remove "beginning January 1, 2009" since this date has passed and is no longer relevant. There is no change to the description of an irrigation technician. §344.31, Exemption for Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Services The commission proposes to amend the title of this section from "Exemption for Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Ser-vices" to "Responsibilities of a Business Owner Who Provides Irrigation Services." The commission pro
	§344.36, Duties and Responsibilities of Installers and Irrigation Technicians The commission proposes to amend the section of this title from "Duties and Responsibilities of Installers and Irrigation Techni-cians" to "Duties and Responsibilities of Irrigation Technicians." The commission proposes to amend §344.36(a) to clarify that ir-rigation technicians are required to work under the supervision of a licensed irrigator and to remove references to "installer" since it is no longer a recognized TCEQ license

	licensed individual and there are no specific recordkeeping re-quirements for irrigation technicians. SUBCHAPTER D, LICENSED IRRIGATOR SEAL §344.40, Seal Required The commission proposes to amend §344.40 so that the rule is strengthened against the inappropriate use of an irrigator's seal. This is to prevent occasions when an irrigator allows another person to use their seal, changes the format of their seal so that it does not meet the requirements in §344.41, or does not sign and date their seal. §344.42,
	its own AVB. AVBs must be installed a minimum of six inches above the highest downstream emission device. These factors increase the cost and complexity of installation with no apprecia-ble benefit. The commission proposes to amend §344.50(b)(4)(A) to also specify potential for back-pressure. The commission proposes to amend §344.50(b)(4)(B) to specify the minimum installation height and that it is determined from the highest downstream opening. Spill resistant vacuum breakers (SVBs) were included as an op-
	its own AVB. AVBs must be installed a minimum of six inches above the highest downstream emission device. These factors increase the cost and complexity of installation with no apprecia-ble benefit. The commission proposes to amend §344.50(b)(4)(A) to also specify potential for back-pressure. The commission proposes to amend §344.50(b)(4)(B) to specify the minimum installation height and that it is determined from the highest downstream opening. Spill resistant vacuum breakers (SVBs) were included as an op-


	§344.52, Installation of Backflow Prevention Device The commission proposes to amend the title of this section from "Installation of Backflow Prevention Device" to "Installation of Backflow Prevention Assembly." The commission proposes to amend §344.52(b) to add the word "prevention" as it is the correct term. The commission proposes to amend §344.52(c) to remove the requirement to provide a test report to the "irrigation system's owner or owner's representative" and to replace the word "de-vice" with assem
	§344.52, Installation of Backflow Prevention Device The commission proposes to amend the title of this section from "Installation of Backflow Prevention Device" to "Installation of Backflow Prevention Assembly." The commission proposes to amend §344.52(b) to add the word "prevention" as it is the correct term. The commission proposes to amend §344.52(c) to remove the requirement to provide a test report to the "irrigation system's owner or owner's representative" and to replace the word "de-vice" with assem
	§344.52, Installation of Backflow Prevention Device The commission proposes to amend the title of this section from "Installation of Backflow Prevention Device" to "Installation of Backflow Prevention Assembly." The commission proposes to amend §344.52(b) to add the word "prevention" as it is the correct term. The commission proposes to amend §344.52(c) to remove the requirement to provide a test report to the "irrigation system's owner or owner's representative" and to replace the word "de-vice" with assem
	The commission proposes to amend §344.62(b)(1) to allow for a 10% discrepancy from the manufacturer's published radius in the spacing of emission devices. This will accommodate varia-tions in installations. This change was made per recommenda-tion from the IAC. The commission proposes to amend §344.62(b)(3) to generalize the requirement for directional spray of emission devices away from impervious surfaces to all irrigation systems and to clarify that this is a requirement for all installations. Exempted a

	The commission proposes to amend §344.63(2)(C) by providing a more concise explanation of irrigation components that should be listed for maintenance and frequency of service. The commission proposes to amend §344.63(2)(D) to improve clarity and to include the defined term §344.1(2) "as-built draw-ing" which is occasionally provided to the owner or owner's rep-resentative upon completion of the installation. The commission proposes to amend §344.63(3) to clarify that the ink on the irrigator's sticker shall
	The commission proposes to amend §344.70(a) to simplify the section by using the term "irrigation services" and to specify that the irrigator's license number must be visible on both outward sides of the vehicle used to advertise irrigation services. The commission proposes to amend §344.70(b) to apply the requirement regardless of the media used to advertise. This change was made per recommendation from the IAC. The commission proposes to amend §344.70(c) to clarify the lo-cation of the of the information 

	Ms. Bearse determined that for each year of the first five years the proposed rules are in effect, the public benefit anticipated would be improved readability and compliance with state law, as well as increased protection of public health and better water conservation. The proposed rulemaking is not anticipated to re-sult in significant fiscal implications for businesses or individuals. Under the Texas Local Government Code, §551.006(d), munic-ipalities have the option of recovering their administrative co
	Ms. Bearse determined that for each year of the first five years the proposed rules are in effect, the public benefit anticipated would be improved readability and compliance with state law, as well as increased protection of public health and better water conservation. The proposed rulemaking is not anticipated to re-sult in significant fiscal implications for businesses or individuals. Under the Texas Local Government Code, §551.006(d), munic-ipalities have the option of recovering their administrative co
	Ms. Bearse determined that for each year of the first five years the proposed rules are in effect, the public benefit anticipated would be improved readability and compliance with state law, as well as increased protection of public health and better water conservation. The proposed rulemaking is not anticipated to re-sult in significant fiscal implications for businesses or individuals. Under the Texas Local Government Code, §551.006(d), munic-ipalities have the option of recovering their administrative co
	ernment Code, §2001.0225(g)(3). A "Major environmental rule" means a rule, the specific intent of which, is to protect the envi-ronment or reduce risks to human health from environmental ex-posure and that may adversely affect in a material way the econ-omy, a sector of the economy, productivity, competition, jobs, the environment, or the public health and safety of the state or a sector of the state. The intent of the proposed rulemaking is to strengthen the rules and provide for better protection of publi
	ernment Code, §2001.0225(g)(3). A "Major environmental rule" means a rule, the specific intent of which, is to protect the envi-ronment or reduce risks to human health from environmental ex-posure and that may adversely affect in a material way the econ-omy, a sector of the economy, productivity, competition, jobs, the environment, or the public health and safety of the state or a sector of the state. The intent of the proposed rulemaking is to strengthen the rules and provide for better protection of publi


	which would otherwise exist in the absence of these regulations. In other words, these rules would not constitute a statutory or constitutional taking because they only update existing rules to comply with current technical standards and conservation meth-ods and do not affect a landowner's rights in private real property. Consistency with the Coastal Management Program The commission reviewed the proposed rulemaking and found that it is not a rulemaking identified in Coastal Coordination Act implementation
	P
	Link
	Link

	Training; Continuing Education; Fees; Advertising; Complaints; Compliance Information; Practice of Occupation; Roster of License Holders and Registrants; and Power to Contract; and under TWC, §49.238, concerning Irrigation Systems. The amendment is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.151, concerning Council Membership; Tex
	Training; Continuing Education; Fees; Advertising; Complaints; Compliance Information; Practice of Occupation; Roster of License Holders and Registrants; and Power to Contract; and under TWC, §49.238, concerning Irrigation Systems. The amendment is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.151, concerning Council Membership; Tex


	of [health] hazard (health hazard or non-health hazard) and hydraulic conditions [backflow condition]. (5) Completion of irrigation system installation--When the landscape irrigation system has been installed, all minimum standards met, all tests performed, and the irrigator is satisfied that the system is operating correctly. (6) Consulting--The act of providing advice, guidance, re-view or recommendations related to landscape irrigation systems. (7) Cross-connection--A physical connection between a public
	of [health] hazard (health hazard or non-health hazard) and hydraulic conditions [backflow condition]. (5) Completion of irrigation system installation--When the landscape irrigation system has been installed, all minimum standards met, all tests performed, and the irrigator is satisfied that the system is operating correctly. (6) Consulting--The act of providing advice, guidance, re-view or recommendations related to landscape irrigation systems. (7) Cross-connection--A physical connection between a public
	of [health] hazard (health hazard or non-health hazard) and hydraulic conditions [backflow condition]. (5) Completion of irrigation system installation--When the landscape irrigation system has been installed, all minimum standards met, all tests performed, and the irrigator is satisfied that the system is operating correctly. (6) Consulting--The act of providing advice, guidance, re-view or recommendations related to landscape irrigation systems. (7) Cross-connection--A physical connection between a public
	(15) [(13)] Head-to-head spacing--The spacing of emission devices such that the distance between them is within [spray or rotary heads equal to] the manufacturer's published radius range and the water spray reaches from device to device. A deviation of 10% or less is acceptable. [of the head.] (16) [(14)] Health hazard--A cross-connection, potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving any substance that can cause death, illness, spread of disease, or has a high probability of causing such eff
	(15) [(13)] Head-to-head spacing--The spacing of emission devices such that the distance between them is within [spray or rotary heads equal to] the manufacturer's published radius range and the water spray reaches from device to device. A deviation of 10% or less is acceptable. [of the head.] (16) [(14)] Health hazard--A cross-connection, potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving any substance that can cause death, illness, spread of disease, or has a high probability of causing such eff
	(15) [(13)] Head-to-head spacing--The spacing of emission devices such that the distance between them is within [spray or rotary heads equal to] the manufacturer's published radius range and the water spray reaches from device to device. A deviation of 10% or less is acceptable. [of the head.] (16) [(14)] Health hazard--A cross-connection, potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving any substance that can cause death, illness, spread of disease, or has a high probability of causing such eff
	(15) [(13)] Head-to-head spacing--The spacing of emission devices such that the distance between them is within [spray or rotary heads equal to] the manufacturer's published radius range and the water spray reaches from device to device. A deviation of 10% or less is acceptable. [of the head.] (16) [(14)] Health hazard--A cross-connection, potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving any substance that can cause death, illness, spread of disease, or has a high probability of causing such eff




	maintain, alter, repair, service or supervise installation of an irrigation system,] including the connection of an irrigation [such] system [in or] to a private or public, raw or potable water supply system or any other water supply, and who is required to be licensed under Chapter 30 of this title (relating to Occupational Licenses and Registrations). (23) Irrigation zone--A subdivision of an irrigation system with a matched precipitation rate based on plant [material] type ([such as] turf, shrubs, or tre
	maintain, alter, repair, service or supervise installation of an irrigation system,] including the connection of an irrigation [such] system [in or] to a private or public, raw or potable water supply system or any other water supply, and who is required to be licensed under Chapter 30 of this title (relating to Occupational Licenses and Registrations). (23) Irrigation zone--A subdivision of an irrigation system with a matched precipitation rate based on plant [material] type ([such as] turf, shrubs, or tre

	(33) New installation--An irrigation system installed at a location where one did not previously exist or is a complete replace-ment of an existing irrigation system. (34) Non-health hazard--A cross-connection, [or] potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving [cross connection from a landscape irrigation system that involves] any substance that generally will [would] not be a health hazard but will [would] constitute a nuisance or be aesthetically objectionable if introduced into the public
	(33) New installation--An irrigation system installed at a location where one did not previously exist or is a complete replace-ment of an existing irrigation system. (34) Non-health hazard--A cross-connection, [or] potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving [cross connection from a landscape irrigation system that involves] any substance that generally will [would] not be a health hazard but will [would] constitute a nuisance or be aesthetically objectionable if introduced into the public
	(33) New installation--An irrigation system installed at a location where one did not previously exist or is a complete replace-ment of an existing irrigation system. (34) Non-health hazard--A cross-connection, [or] potential contamination hazard, or other situation involving [cross connection from a landscape irrigation system that involves] any substance that generally will [would] not be a health hazard but will [would] constitute a nuisance or be aesthetically objectionable if introduced into the public



	(45) [(44)] Water conservation--The design, installation, service, and operation of an irrigation system in a manner that prevents the waste of water, promotes the most efficient use of water, and applies the least amount of water that is required to maintain healthy individual plant material or turf, reduce dust, and control erosion. (46) [(45)] Zone flow--A measurement, in gallons per minute or gallons per hour, of the actual flow of water through a zone valve, calculated by individually opening each zone
	(45) [(44)] Water conservation--The design, installation, service, and operation of an irrigation system in a manner that prevents the waste of water, promotes the most efficient use of water, and applies the least amount of water that is required to maintain healthy individual plant material or turf, reduce dust, and control erosion. (46) [(45)] Zone flow--A measurement, in gallons per minute or gallons per hour, of the actual flow of water through a zone valve, calculated by individually opening each zone
	(45) [(44)] Water conservation--The design, installation, service, and operation of an irrigation system in a manner that prevents the waste of water, promotes the most efficient use of water, and applies the least amount of water that is required to maintain healthy individual plant material or turf, reduce dust, and control erosion. (46) [(45)] Zone flow--A measurement, in gallons per minute or gallons per hour, of the actual flow of water through a zone valve, calculated by individually opening each zone
	(45) [(44)] Water conservation--The design, installation, service, and operation of an irrigation system in a manner that prevents the waste of water, promotes the most efficient use of water, and applies the least amount of water that is required to maintain healthy individual plant material or turf, reduce dust, and control erosion. (46) [(45)] Zone flow--A measurement, in gallons per minute or gallons per hour, of the actual flow of water through a zone valve, calculated by individually opening each zone
	(45) [(44)] Water conservation--The design, installation, service, and operation of an irrigation system in a manner that prevents the waste of water, promotes the most efficient use of water, and applies the least amount of water that is required to maintain healthy individual plant material or turf, reduce dust, and control erosion. (46) [(45)] Zone flow--A measurement, in gallons per minute or gallons per hour, of the actual flow of water through a zone valve, calculated by individually opening each zone
	(45) [(44)] Water conservation--The design, installation, service, and operation of an irrigation system in a manner that prevents the waste of water, promotes the most efficient use of water, and applies the least amount of water that is required to maintain healthy individual plant material or turf, reduce dust, and control erosion. (46) [(45)] Zone flow--A measurement, in gallons per minute or gallons per hour, of the actual flow of water through a zone valve, calculated by individually opening each zone




	Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. These proposed amendments, implement TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Occu-pations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.20. Purpose of Standards. (a) The correct practice of irrigation as a science and profes-sion is essential for the protection and conservation of the water re-sources
	Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. These proposed amendments, implement TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Occu-pations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.20. Purpose of Standards. (a) The correct practice of irrigation as a science and profes-sion is essential for the protection and conservation of the water re-sources
	Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. These proposed amendments, implement TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Occu-pations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.20. Purpose of Standards. (a) The correct practice of irrigation as a science and profes-sion is essential for the protection and conservation of the water re-sources
	Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. These proposed amendments, implement TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Occu-pations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.20. Purpose of Standards. (a) The correct practice of irrigation as a science and profes-sion is essential for the protection and conservation of the water re-sources


	(c) All irrigators, [installers,] irrigation technicians, and in-spectors shall be knowledgeable of local requirements related to land-scape irrigation systems. §344.24. Local Regulation and Inspection. (a) Where any city, town, county, water [special purpose] dis-trict, other political subdivision of the state, or public water supplier requires licensed irrigators, [installers,] irrigation technicians, or irri-gation inspectors to comply with reasonable inspection requirements, ordinances, or regulations d
	Robert Martinez Director, Environmental Law Division Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 293-1806 ♦ ♦ ♦ SUBCHAPTER C. REQUIREMENTS FOR LICENSED IRRIGATORS, [INSTALLERS,] IRRIGATION TECHNICIANS, AND IRRIGATION INSPECTORS 30 TAC §§344.30, 344.31, 344.33 -344.38 Statutory Authority These amendments are proposed under Texas Water Code (TWC), §5.013, concerning the General Jurisdiction of the Commission; TWC, §5.1
	Robert Martinez Director, Environmental Law Division Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 293-1806 ♦ ♦ ♦ SUBCHAPTER C. REQUIREMENTS FOR LICENSED IRRIGATORS, [INSTALLERS,] IRRIGATION TECHNICIANS, AND IRRIGATION INSPECTORS 30 TAC §§344.30, 344.31, 344.33 -344.38 Statutory Authority These amendments are proposed under Texas Water Code (TWC), §5.013, concerning the General Jurisdiction of the Commission; TWC, §5.1




	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 
	(b) [(c)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian is an individual who: (1) connects an irrigation system to a water supply; (2) under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, installs, maintains, alters, repairs, or services a landscape irrigation system; (3) represents to anyone that the individual can perform any or all of these functions; and (4) is required to hold a valid irrigation technician license issued under Chapter 30 of this title. (c) [(d)] All irrigators[, installers,] and 




	exempt business owner who engages in landscape irrigation is respon-sible for verifying the validity of the license belonging to all irrigators and irrigation technicians performing irrigation services for the busi-ness. An exempt business owner who engages in landscape irrigation is responsible for designating an irrigator-in-charge. §344.33. Display of License. (a) Irrigators[, installers,] and irrigation technicians shall prominently display their license certificate at the place of irrigation business o
	exempt business owner who engages in landscape irrigation is respon-sible for verifying the validity of the license belonging to all irrigators and irrigation technicians performing irrigation services for the busi-ness. An exempt business owner who engages in landscape irrigation is responsible for designating an irrigator-in-charge. §344.33. Display of License. (a) Irrigators[, installers,] and irrigation technicians shall prominently display their license certificate at the place of irrigation business o


	(6) conserving water; (7) developing and following an irrigation plan for each new irrigation system; (8) designing an irrigation system that complies with the requirements of this chapter; (9) providing on-site supervision of the installation of [an] irrigation systems [system beginning January 1, 2010]; (10) providing supervision to an irrigation technician who is conducting irrigation services [while connecting an irrigation system to a water supply, installing, maintaining, altering, repairing, or servi
	(6) conserving water; (7) developing and following an irrigation plan for each new irrigation system; (8) designing an irrigation system that complies with the requirements of this chapter; (9) providing on-site supervision of the installation of [an] irrigation systems [system beginning January 1, 2010]; (10) providing supervision to an irrigation technician who is conducting irrigation services [while connecting an irrigation system to a water supply, installing, maintaining, altering, repairing, or servi

	[(c) Through December 31, 2009, an installer is responsible for the connection of an irrigation system to a water supply under the supervision of a licensed irrigator.] (c) [(d)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian, under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, is responsible for: (1) connecting an irrigation system to a water supply; and (2) providing on-site supervision of the installation, main-tenance, alteration, repair, service of an irrigation system including the final walk th
	[(c) Through December 31, 2009, an installer is responsible for the connection of an irrigation system to a water supply under the supervision of a licensed irrigator.] (c) [(d)] An [Beginning January 1, 2009, an] irrigation techni-cian, under the supervision of a licensed irrigator, is responsible for: (1) connecting an irrigation system to a water supply; and (2) providing on-site supervision of the installation, main-tenance, alteration, repair, service of an irrigation system including the final walk th


	repairs, or service of an irrigation system and] advertisement of irrigation services; and [(6) maintaining records according to this chapter.] (7) each inspector shall maintain a log of all irrigation sys-tems inspected that includes, but is not limited to, the system loca-tion, property owner, irrigator responsible for installation, permit sta-tus, problems noted during the inspection, and date of the inspection. The log must be kept for three years. The log shall be available for review within two busine
	repairs, or service of an irrigation system and] advertisement of irrigation services; and [(6) maintaining records according to this chapter.] (7) each inspector shall maintain a log of all irrigation sys-tems inspected that includes, but is not limited to, the system loca-tion, property owner, irrigator responsible for installation, permit sta-tus, problems noted during the inspection, and date of the inspection. The log must be kept for three years. The log shall be available for review within two busine
	repairs, or service of an irrigation system and] advertisement of irrigation services; and [(6) maintaining records according to this chapter.] (7) each inspector shall maintain a log of all irrigation sys-tems inspected that includes, but is not limited to, the system loca-tion, property owner, irrigator responsible for installation, permit sta-tus, problems noted during the inspection, and date of the inspection. The log must be kept for three years. The log shall be available for review within two busine
	repairs, or service of an irrigation system and] advertisement of irrigation services; and [(6) maintaining records according to this chapter.] (7) each inspector shall maintain a log of all irrigation sys-tems inspected that includes, but is not limited to, the system loca-tion, property owner, irrigator responsible for installation, permit sta-tus, problems noted during the inspection, and date of the inspection. The log must be kept for three years. The log shall be available for review within two busine




	Power to Contract; and under TWC §49.238, concerning Irri-gation Systems. The repealed section is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; and Texas Occupations Code, §1903.251, concerning License Required. The repealed section proposed under Texas Local Government Code, §551.006, concerning Irrigation Systems. Finally, the repealed section is also proposed
	Power to Contract; and under TWC §49.238, concerning Irri-gation Systems. The repealed section is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; and Texas Occupations Code, §1903.251, concerning License Required. The repealed section proposed under Texas Local Government Code, §551.006, concerning Irrigation Systems. Finally, the repealed section is also proposed
	Power to Contract; and under TWC §49.238, concerning Irri-gation Systems. The repealed section is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; and Texas Occupations Code, §1903.251, concerning License Required. The repealed section proposed under Texas Local Government Code, §551.006, concerning Irrigation Systems. Finally, the repealed section is also proposed
	Power to Contract; and under TWC §49.238, concerning Irri-gation Systems. The repealed section is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; and Texas Occupations Code, §1903.251, concerning License Required. The repealed section proposed under Texas Local Government Code, §551.006, concerning Irrigation Systems. Finally, the repealed section is also proposed
	Power to Contract; and under TWC §49.238, concerning Irri-gation Systems. The repealed section is also proposed under Texas Occupations Code, §1903.001, concerning Definitions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.002, concerning Exemptions; Texas Occupations Code, §1903.053, concerning Standards; and Texas Occupations Code, §1903.251, concerning License Required. The repealed section proposed under Texas Local Government Code, §551.006, concerning Irrigation Systems. Finally, the repealed section is also proposed



	Health and Safety Code (THSC), §341.033, concerning Protec-tion of Public Water Supplies; and THSC, §341.034, concerning Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. These proposed amendments implement TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Occu-pations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.40. Seal Required. Each irrigator, upon being 
	Health and Safety Code (THSC), §341.033, concerning Protec-tion of Public Water Supplies; and THSC, §341.034, concerning Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. These proposed amendments implement TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Occu-pations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.40. Seal Required. Each irrigator, upon being 
	(g) Irrigators shall sign, seal and date the irrigation plan and specifications, contract, addenda or change orders, warranty, and the maintenance checklist. The agency certifies that legal counsel has reviewed the pro-posal and found it to be within the state agency's legal authority to adopt. Filed with the Office of the Secretary of State on January 16, 2020. TRD-202000177 Robert Martinez Director, Environmental Law Division Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Earliest possible date of adoption: Ma

	must be approved by the American Society of Sanitary Engineers; or the Foundation for Cross-Connection Control and Hydraulic Research, University of Southern California; or the Uniform Plumbing Code; or any other laboratory that has equivalent capabilities for both the lab-oratory and field evaluation of backflow prevention assemblies. The backflow prevention device must be installed in accordance with the laboratory approval standards or if the approval does not include spe-cific installation information, 
	must be approved by the American Society of Sanitary Engineers; or the Foundation for Cross-Connection Control and Hydraulic Research, University of Southern California; or the Uniform Plumbing Code; or any other laboratory that has equivalent capabilities for both the lab-oratory and field evaluation of backflow prevention assemblies. The backflow prevention device must be installed in accordance with the laboratory approval standards or if the approval does not include spe-cific installation information, 
	must be approved by the American Society of Sanitary Engineers; or the Foundation for Cross-Connection Control and Hydraulic Research, University of Southern California; or the Uniform Plumbing Code; or any other laboratory that has equivalent capabilities for both the lab-oratory and field evaluation of backflow prevention assemblies. The backflow prevention device must be installed in accordance with the laboratory approval standards or if the approval does not include spe-cific installation information, 
	must be approved by the American Society of Sanitary Engineers; or the Foundation for Cross-Connection Control and Hydraulic Research, University of Southern California; or the Uniform Plumbing Code; or any other laboratory that has equivalent capabilities for both the lab-oratory and field evaluation of backflow prevention assemblies. The backflow prevention device must be installed in accordance with the laboratory approval standards or if the approval does not include spe-cific installation information, 

	[(E) a separate atmospheric vacuum breaker is installed on the discharge side of each irrigation control valve, between the valve and all the emission devices that the valve controls.] [(c) Backflow prevention devices used in applications desig-nated as health hazards must be tested upon installation and annually thereafter.] (c) [(d)] If there are no conditions that present a health hazard, double check valve backflow prevention assemblies may be used to prevent backflow if the assembly [device] is tested 
	[(E) a separate atmospheric vacuum breaker is installed on the discharge side of each irrigation control valve, between the valve and all the emission devices that the valve controls.] [(c) Backflow prevention devices used in applications desig-nated as health hazards must be tested upon installation and annually thereafter.] (c) [(d)] If there are no conditions that present a health hazard, double check valve backflow prevention assemblies may be used to prevent backflow if the assembly [device] is tested 


	potable water supply must be connected through a reduced pressure principle backflow device.] (d) If an irrigation system is designed or installed on a property that is served by an on-site sewage facility, as defined in Chapter 285 of this title (relating to On-Site Sewage Facilities), then: (1) all irrigation piping and valves shall [must] meet the separation distances from the On-Site Sewage Facilities system as re-quired for a private water line in §285.91(10) of this title (relating to Tables), concern
	potable water supply must be connected through a reduced pressure principle backflow device.] (d) If an irrigation system is designed or installed on a property that is served by an on-site sewage facility, as defined in Chapter 285 of this title (relating to On-Site Sewage Facilities), then: (1) all irrigation piping and valves shall [must] meet the separation distances from the On-Site Sewage Facilities system as re-quired for a private water line in §285.91(10) of this title (relating to Tables), concern



	MAINTAINING LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION SYSTEMS 30 TAC §§344.60 -344.66 Statutory Authority These amendments and new section are proposed under Texas Water Code (TWC), §5.013, concerning the General Jurisdiction of the Commission; TWC, §5.102, concerning General Powers; TWC, §5.103, concerning Rules; TWC, §5.105, concerning Gen-eral Policy; and TWC, §5.107, concerning Advisory Committees, Work Groups, and Task Forces; TWC, Chapter 37, §§37.001 -37.015, concerning: Definitions; Rules; License or Registra-tion Requi
	MAINTAINING LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION SYSTEMS 30 TAC §§344.60 -344.66 Statutory Authority These amendments and new section are proposed under Texas Water Code (TWC), §5.013, concerning the General Jurisdiction of the Commission; TWC, §5.102, concerning General Powers; TWC, §5.103, concerning Rules; TWC, §5.105, concerning Gen-eral Policy; and TWC, §5.107, concerning Advisory Committees, Work Groups, and Task Forces; TWC, Chapter 37, §§37.001 -37.015, concerning: Definitions; Rules; License or Registra-tion Requi
	complete coverage of the area to be irrigated, it must be noted on the irrigation plan]. (c) All irrigation plans used for construction must be drawn to scale. The plan must include, at a minimum, the following information: (1) the irrigator's seal, signature, and date of signing; (2) all major physical features in accordance with subsec-tion (b) of this section including, but not limited to, property lines, streets, sidewalks, buildings, fences, flower bed lines, and the bound-aries of the areas to be wate
	complete coverage of the area to be irrigated, it must be noted on the irrigation plan]. (c) All irrigation plans used for construction must be drawn to scale. The plan must include, at a minimum, the following information: (1) the irrigator's seal, signature, and date of signing; (2) all major physical features in accordance with subsec-tion (b) of this section including, but not limited to, property lines, streets, sidewalks, buildings, fences, flower bed lines, and the bound-aries of the areas to be wate
	complete coverage of the area to be irrigated, it must be noted on the irrigation plan]. (c) All irrigation plans used for construction must be drawn to scale. The plan must include, at a minimum, the following information: (1) the irrigator's seal, signature, and date of signing; (2) all major physical features in accordance with subsec-tion (b) of this section including, but not limited to, property lines, streets, sidewalks, buildings, fences, flower bed lines, and the bound-aries of the areas to be wate
	complete coverage of the area to be irrigated, it must be noted on the irrigation plan]. (c) All irrigation plans used for construction must be drawn to scale. The plan must include, at a minimum, the following information: (1) the irrigator's seal, signature, and date of signing; (2) all major physical features in accordance with subsec-tion (b) of this section including, but not limited to, property lines, streets, sidewalks, buildings, fences, flower bed lines, and the bound-aries of the areas to be wate

	ufacturer's published specifications for a specific emission device at a specific operating pressure. In no instance shall the spacing exceed plus or minus 10% of the manufacturer's published radius or spacing of the device(s). (2) New irrigation systems shall not utilize above-ground spray emission devices in landscapes that are less than 48 inches not including the impervious surfaces in either length or width and which contain impervious pedestrian or vehicular traffic surfaces along two or more perimete

	published recommendations. Repairs to existing automatic irrigation systems that require replacement of an existing controller must include a sensor or other technology designed to inhibit or interrupt operation of the irrigation system during periods of moisture or rainfall. El Paso, Hudspeth, Culberson, Jeff Davis, Presidio, Brewster, Terrell, Loving, Winkler, Ward, Reeves, Ector, Crane and Pecos Counties are excluded from this requirement. (k) Isolation valve. All new irrigation systems must include an i
	the landscape irrigation system is being installed. When an irrigator is not on-site, the irrigator shall be responsible for ensuring that a licensed irrigation technician is on-site to supervise the installation of the irri-gation system. (p) Valve boxes. A valve box shall be used as a durable, rigid enclosure for valves and/or any other irrigation system components that require subsurface protection. §344.63. Completion of Irrigation System Installation. Upon completion of the irrigation system, the irrig

	irrigator who subsequently conducts any irrigation service on the same irrigation system.] (a) [(b)] All trenches and holes created during the mainte-nance, alteration, repair, or service of an irrigation system must be backfilled and returned to the original grade with suitable soil free of any objects that could damage the plumbing of the irrigation system. The backfill must be compacted such that a depression does not develop [select backfill]. (b) [(c)] Colored polyvinyl chloride (PVC) pipe primer solve
	irrigator who subsequently conducts any irrigation service on the same irrigation system.] (a) [(b)] All trenches and holes created during the mainte-nance, alteration, repair, or service of an irrigation system must be backfilled and returned to the original grade with suitable soil free of any objects that could damage the plumbing of the irrigation system. The backfill must be compacted such that a depression does not develop [select backfill]. (b) [(c)] Colored polyvinyl chloride (PVC) pipe primer solve
	irrigator who subsequently conducts any irrigation service on the same irrigation system.] (a) [(b)] All trenches and holes created during the mainte-nance, alteration, repair, or service of an irrigation system must be backfilled and returned to the original grade with suitable soil free of any objects that could damage the plumbing of the irrigation system. The backfill must be compacted such that a depression does not develop [select backfill]. (b) [(c)] Colored polyvinyl chloride (PVC) pipe primer solve
	irrigator who subsequently conducts any irrigation service on the same irrigation system.] (a) [(b)] All trenches and holes created during the mainte-nance, alteration, repair, or service of an irrigation system must be backfilled and returned to the original grade with suitable soil free of any objects that could damage the plumbing of the irrigation system. The backfill must be compacted such that a depression does not develop [select backfill]. (b) [(c)] Colored polyvinyl chloride (PVC) pipe primer solve

	TRD-202000179 Robert Martinez Director, Environmental Law Division Texas Commission on Environmental Quality Earliest possible date of adoption: March 1, 2020 For further information, please call: (512) 239-1806 ♦ ♦ ♦ SUBCHAPTER G. ADVERTISING, CONTRACT, AND WARRANTY 30 TAC §§344.70 -344.72 Statutory Authority These amendments are proposed under Texas Water Code (TWC), §5.013, concerning the General Jurisdiction of the Commission; TWC, §5.102, concerning General Powers; TWC, §5.103, concerning Rules; TWC, §

	the [The] name, mailing address, and telephone number of the commis-sion must be prominently displayed on a legible sign [and displayed] in plain view for the purpose of addressing complaints [at the permanent structure where irrigation business is primarily conducted and irriga-tion records are kept]. §344.71. Contracts. (a) All contracts to install an irrigation system must be in writ-ing and signed by each party and must specify the irrigator's name, license number, business address, current business tel
	the [The] name, mailing address, and telephone number of the commis-sion must be prominently displayed on a legible sign [and displayed] in plain view for the purpose of addressing complaints [at the permanent structure where irrigation business is primarily conducted and irriga-tion records are kept]. §344.71. Contracts. (a) All contracts to install an irrigation system must be in writ-ing and signed by each party and must specify the irrigator's name, license number, business address, current business tel
	the [The] name, mailing address, and telephone number of the commis-sion must be prominently displayed on a legible sign [and displayed] in plain view for the purpose of addressing complaints [at the permanent structure where irrigation business is primarily conducted and irriga-tion records are kept]. §344.71. Contracts. (a) All contracts to install an irrigation system must be in writ-ing and signed by each party and must specify the irrigator's name, license number, business address, current business tel

	L
	LI
	LBody
	StyleSpan
	Link

	StyleSpan
	Link



	LI
	LBody
	StyleSpan
	Link

	StyleSpan
	Link




	L
	LI
	LBody
	StyleSpan
	Link

	StyleSpan
	Link




	(c) On all maintenance, alterations, repairs, or service to ex-isting irrigation systems, an irrigator shall present the irrigation sys-tem's owner or owner's representative a written and sealed document that details the work performed and identifies the materials furnished [in the maintenance, alteration, repair, or service]. If a warranty is pro-vided, the irrigator shall abide by the terms. The warranty document must include the irrigator's name and business contact information. The irrigator is responsi


	THSC, §341.034, concerning Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. The proposed amendment implements TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Oc-cupations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, 1903.151, 1903.152, 1903.155, 1903.157, 1903.158, 1903.159, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.80. Irrigator Advisory Council. (a) The Irrigator Advisory Council is composed of 
	THSC, §341.034, concerning Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. The proposed amendment implements TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Oc-cupations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, 1903.151, 1903.152, 1903.155, 1903.157, 1903.158, 1903.159, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.80. Irrigator Advisory Council. (a) The Irrigator Advisory Council is composed of 
	THSC, §341.034, concerning Licensing and Registration of Persons Who Perform Duties Relating to Public Water Supplies. The proposed amendment implements TWC, §§5.013, 5.102, 5.103, 5.105, 5.107, 37.001 -37.015 and 49.238; Texas Oc-cupations Code, §§1903.001, 1903.002, 1903.053, 1903.151, 1903.152, 1903.155, 1903.157, 1903.158, 1903.159, and 1903.251; Texas Local Government Code, §551.006; and THSC, §341.033 and §341.034. §344.80. Irrigator Advisory Council. (a) The Irrigator Advisory Council is composed of 
	(2) does not maintain, during service on the council, the qualifications that are required by subsection (b) or (c) of this section for appointment to the council; or (3) misses three consecutive regularly scheduled meetings or more than half of all the regularly scheduled meetings in a one-year period. (e) The members of the council serve staggered six-year terms, with the terms expiring February 1 of each odd-numbered year. For cases where a council member cannot finish their term, the replacement member 
	(2) does not maintain, during service on the council, the qualifications that are required by subsection (b) or (c) of this section for appointment to the council; or (3) misses three consecutive regularly scheduled meetings or more than half of all the regularly scheduled meetings in a one-year period. (e) The members of the council serve staggered six-year terms, with the terms expiring February 1 of each odd-numbered year. For cases where a council member cannot finish their term, the replacement member 
	(2) does not maintain, during service on the council, the qualifications that are required by subsection (b) or (c) of this section for appointment to the council; or (3) misses three consecutive regularly scheduled meetings or more than half of all the regularly scheduled meetings in a one-year period. (e) The members of the council serve staggered six-year terms, with the terms expiring February 1 of each odd-numbered year. For cases where a council member cannot finish their term, the replacement member 











